
CHAVES COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS 
REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING AGENDA 

January 15, 2015 –9:00 a.m. 
Chaves County Administrative Center – Joseph R. Skeen Building 

Commission Chambers - #1 St. Mary’s Place 
 

CALL TO ORDER 

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

DETERMINATION OF QUORUM 

APPROVAL OF MINUTES 

PRESENTATIONS 

AGENDA ITEMS 
 

A. AGREEMENTS AND RESOLUTIONS 

1. Agreement A-15-001-between Chaves County and the NM Energy, Minerals and Natural 
Resources Department 
 

2. A. Resolution R-15-001-Notice for Public Meetings for the Chaves   
 County Board of Commissioners 
B. Resolution R-15-002-Notice for Public Meetings for the Chaves   
 County Indigent Hospital/Health Care Board 
 

3. Resolution R-15-003-Approval of Budget and Transfer Adjustments 
 

4. Resolution R-15-004-Declaring the intent of Chaves County to Issue Industrial Revenue 
Bonds on behalf of Nextera Energy Resources, LLC   

 
B. ITB’S AND RFP’S 

5. A. ITB-14-4-Road Department Toilet Rooms 
B. Agreement A-14-043-between Chaves County and RCC, LLC, dba 
 Rivercrest Construction 
 

6. ITB-14-5-One or more New Nissan and Toyota Passenger Vans 
 

C. OTHER BUSINESS 
 
7. Election of Officers for 2015 

8. Permission to Publish for a Public Hearing Regarding Potential Low Income Tax Rebate 
Ordinance 

 
APPROVAL OF CHECKS 
APPROVAL OF REPORTS 
 



UNSCHEDULED COMMUNICATIONS LIMITED TO FIVE MINUTES PER VISITOR 
NO FORMAL ACTION TAKEN BY COMMISSION  

 
 COUNTY MANAGERS’ COMMUNICATIONS 
 COMMISSIONER’S COMMUNICATIONS 
 SIGNATURE OF DOCUMENTS 
 ADJOURNMENT 
 
If you are an individual with a disability who is in need of a reader, qualified sign language interpreter, or any form of 
auxiliary aid or service to attend or participate in the hearing of a meeting, please contact the County Commissioner’s 
office at 575-624-6600.  This should be done at least one week prior to the meeting.  Public documents, including the 
agenda and minutes, can be provided in various accessible formats.  Please contact the County Commissioner’s office if 
a summary or other type of accessible format is needed. 



AGENDA ITEM:____1___ Agreement A-15-001 between Chaves 
County and the NM Energy, Minerals 
and Natural Resources Department 

       
 
MEETING DATE: 01/15/15  
 

STAFF SUMMARY 
 
 
Action Requested by: Georgianna Hunt, Community Development Division 
 
Action Requested: Approval of Agreement A-15-001  
 
 
Item Summary:  
 
The Berrendo Volunteer Fire Department was awarded a grant under the Volunteer Fire 
Assistance (VFA) funding for Fiscal Year 2013.   
 
The grant funding provides for the following: 
 
$10,000.00  
For the purchase of Personal Protection Equipment (PPE) and Fire Fighting Equipment (FFE) as 
designated in the Department’s VFA grant application. 
 
The term of the agreement will be December 31, 2015. 
 
Staff recommends approval. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:  Agreement A-15-001      
 
    
 
Summary by:  Georgianna Hunt               
 
Title:   Community Development Project Specialist  















AGENDA ITEM: __2_____ A.   Resolution R-15-001-Notice for Public 
 Meetings for the Chaves County Board 
 of Commissioners 

 
 B. Resolution R-15-002-Notice for Public 

 Meetings for the Chaves County 
 Indigent Hospital/Health Care Board  
  

      
MEETING DATE:   January 15, 2015    
 
 

STAFF SUMMARY REPORT 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION REQUESTED BY:   Stanton L. Riggs 
  
ACTION REQUESTED:    Approve Resolutions    
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
ITEM SUMMARY: 
 
 In accordance with the Open Meetings Act, the Commission is required to publish a 
notice for public meetings each year.  The attached resolutions, if approved, would establish 
Commission and Indigent Hospital/Health Care Board meetings once monthly on the third 
Thursday of each month with IHC at 8:30 a.m. and Commission at 9:00 a.m. 
 
 Staff recommends approval. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________ 
 
SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:  Resolution R-15-001 and R-15-002 
____________________________________________________________________________ 
 
SUMMARY BY:   Stanton L. Riggs 
 
TITLE:    County Manager    



RESOLUTION R-15-001 
NOTICE FOR PUBLIC MEETINGS 

 
 WHEREAS, Section 10-15-1(D) of the Open Meetings Act (NMSA 1978, Sections 10-15-
1 to –4) states, that, except as may be otherwise provided in the Constitution for the provisions of 
the Open Meetings Act, all meetings of a quorum of any members of any boards, counsel, 
commission, administrative adjudicatory body or other policy making body of any state or local 
public agency for the purpose of formulating public policy, discussing public business, or for the 
purpose of taking any action within the authority of or the delegated authority of such body, are 
declared to be public meetings open to the public at all times; and 
 
 WHEREAS, any meeting subject to the Open Meetings Act at which the discussion or 
adoption of any proposed resolution, rule, regulation or formal action occurs shall be held only 
after reasonable notice to the public; and 
 
 WHEREAS, Section 10-15-1(D) of the Open Meetings Act requires the Chaves County 
Commission to determine annually what constitutes reasonable notice of its public meetings. 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Chaves County 
Commissioners that: 
 

1. The Chaves County Commission will meet once monthly.  The meetings will be 
held at 9:00 a.m. on the third Thursday of each month, unless otherwise specifically 
changed by the Chairman with ten (10) days’ notice.  The meetings will be held in 
the Chaves County Commission Chambers of the Chaves County Administrative 
Center located at #1 St. Mary’s Place Roswell, New Mexico. 

 
2. The agenda will be available at least seventy-two (72) hours prior to the meeting 

from the County Commissioner’s Office located in the Chaves County 
Administrative Center, Roswell, New Mexico.  Notice of any other regular meeting 
will be ten (10) days in advance of the meeting date.  The notice shall indicate how 
a copy of the agenda may be obtained. 

 
3. The Chairman or a majority of the members upon three (3) days notice shall call 

special meetings.  The notice shall include an agenda for the meeting or 
information on how members of the public may obtain a copy of the agenda.  The 
agenda shall be available to the public at least seventy-two (72) hours before any 
special meeting. 

 
4. Emergency meetings will be called only under unforeseen circumstances, which 

demand immediate action to protect the health, safety and property of citizens or to 
protect the public body from substantial financial loss. 

 
5. The Board of County Commissioners will avoid emergency meetings whenever 

possible.  The Chairman or majority of the members upon twenty-four (24) hours 
notice may call emergency meetings, unless threats of personal injury or property 
damage require less notice.  The notice for all emergency meetings shall include an 
agenda for the meeting or information on how the public may obtain a copy of the 
agenda. 



 
6. For the purpose of regular meetings described in paragraph 2 of this Resolution, 

notice requirements are met if notice of the date, time, place and agenda is placed 
in newspapers of general circulation in Chaves County in the State of New Mexico 
and posted on the bulletin board located in the west hallway of the Chaves County 
Administrative Building.  Although not a requirement, the agenda will also be 
posted on the County website at www.co.chaves.nm.us.  The County 
Commissioner’s office shall also fax and/or e-mail copies of the written notice to 
those broadcast stations licensed by the Federal Communications Commission and 
newspapers of general circulation, which have made a written request for notice of 
public meetings. 

 
7. For the purpose of special meetings and emergency meetings described in 

paragraph 3 and 4 of this Resolution, notice requirements shall be met by posting 
notice of the date, time and place and agenda on the bulletin board located in the 
west hallway of the Chaves County Administrative Building.  The County 
Commissioner’s office shall also fax copies of the written notice to those broadcast 
stations licensed by the Federal Communications Commission and newspapers of 
general circulation, which have made a written request for notice of public 
meetings. 

 
8. In addition to the information specified above, all notices shall include the 

following language: 
 
 If you are an individual with a disability who is in need of a reader, qualified sign 
 language interpreter, or any form of auxiliary aid, or service to attend or 
 participate in the hearing of a meeting, please contact the County Commissioner’s 
 office at 624-6600.  This should be done at least one week prior to the meeting.  
 Public documents, including the agenda and minutes can be provided in various 
 accessible formats.  Please contact the County Commissioner’s office if a summary 
 or other type of accessible format is needed. 
 
9.  A member of the Chaves County Board of Commissioners may participate by 

telephone or other similar communications equipment when it is difficult or 
impossible for the Commissioner to attend the meeting in person, provided that the 
Commissioner can be identified when speaking, all participants are able to hear 
each other at the same time and members of the public attending the meeting are 
able to hear any member of the Commission. 

 
10. The Board of Commissioners may close a meeting to the public only if the subject 

matter of such discussion or action is exempted from the open meeting 
requirements under Section 10-15-1(H) of the Open Meetings Act. 

 
a. If any meeting is closed during an open meeting, such closure shall be 

approved by the majority vote of a quorum of the Commission taken during 
the open meeting.  The authority for the closure and the subject to be 
discussed shall be stated with reasonable specificity in the motion for 
closure and the vote on closure on each individual member shall be 



recorded in the minutes.  Only those subjects specified in the motion may 
be discussed in the closed meeting. 

 
b. If a decision to hold a closed meeting is made when the Commission is not 

in an open meeting, the closed meeting shall not be held until public notice, 
appropriate under the circumstances, stating the specific provisions of law 
authorizing the closed meeting and the subject to be discussed with 
reasonable specificity is given to the members and the general public. 

 
c. Following completion of any closed meeting, the minutes of the open 

meeting that was closed, or the minutes of the next open meeting if the 
closed meeting was separately scheduled, shall state whether the matters 
discussed in the closed meeting were limited only to those specified in the 
motion for notice for closure. 

 
d. Except as provided in Section 10-15-1(H) of the Open Meetings Act, any 

action taken as a result of discussions in the closed meetings shall be made 
by the vote of the Commission in an open public meeting. 

 
Passed this 15th day of January, 2015. 
 
 
      BOARD OF CHAVES COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 
 
 
      ______________________________________ 
      James W. Duffey, Member 
   
      ___________________________________ 
      Kyle D. “Smiley” Wooton, Member 
 
ATTEST:     ___________________________________ 
      Kim Chesser, Member 
 
      ___________________________________ 
_____________________   Robert Corn, Member 
Dave Kunko 
County Clerk     ___________________________________ 
      William E. Cavin, Member 



RESOLUTION R-15-002 
NOTICE FOR PUBLIC MEETINGS 

 
 WHEREAS, Section 10-15-1(D) of the Open Meetings Act (NMSA 1978, Sections 10-15-
1 to –4) states, that, except as may be otherwise provided in the Constitution for the provisions of 
the Open Meetings Act, all meetings of a quorum of any members of any boards, counsel, 
commission, administrative adjudicatory body or other policy making body of any state or local 
public agency for the purpose of formulating public policy, discussing public business, or for the 
purpose of taking any action within the authority of or the delegated authority of such body, are 
declared to be public meetings open to the public at all times; and 
 
 WHEREAS, any meeting subject to the Open Meetings Act at which the discussion or 
adoption of any proposed resolution, rule, regulation or formal action occurs shall be held only 
after reasonable notice to the public; and 
 
 WHEREAS, Section 10-15-1(D) of the Open Meetings Act requires the Chaves County 
Commission/Chaves County Indigent Hospital/Health Care Board to determine annually what 
constitutes reasonable notice of its public meetings. 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Chaves County 
Commissioners/Chaves County Indigent Hospital/Health Care Board that: 
 

1. The Chaves County Indigent Hospital/Health Care Board will meet once monthly 
to approve claims.  The meetings will be held at 8:30 a.m. on the third Thursday of 
each month, unless otherwise specifically changed by the Chairman with ten (10) 
days’ notice.  The meetings will be held in the Chaves County Commission 
Chambers of the Chaves County Administrative Center located at #1 St. Mary’s 
Place Roswell, New Mexico. 

 
2. The agenda will be available at least seventy-two (72) hours prior to the meeting 

from the IHC Coordinator whose office is located in the Chaves County 
Administrative Center, Roswell, New Mexico.  Notice of any other regular meeting 
will be ten (10) days in advance of the meeting date.  The notice shall indicate how 
a copy of the agenda may be obtained. 

 
3. The Chairman or a majority of the members upon three (3) days notice shall call 

special meetings.  The notice shall include an agenda for the meeting or 
information on how members of the public may obtain a copy of the agenda.  The 
agenda shall be available to the public at least seventy-two (72) hours before any 
special meeting. 

 
4. Emergency meetings will be called only under unforeseen circumstances, which 

demand immediate action to protect the health, safety and property of citizens or to 
protect the public body from substantial financial loss. 

 
5. The Chaves County Indigent Hospital/Health Care Board will avoid emergency 

meetings whenever possible.  The Chairman or majority of the members upon 
twenty-four (24) hours notice may call emergency meetings, unless threats of 
personal injury or property damage require less notice.  The notice for all 



emergency meetings shall include an agenda for the meeting or information on how 
the public may obtain a copy of the agenda. 

 
6. For the purpose of regular meetings described in paragraph 2 of this Resolution, 

notice requirements are met if notice of the date, time, place and agenda is placed 
in newspapers of general circulation in Chaves County in the State of New Mexico 
and/or posted on the bulletin board located in the west hallway of the Chaves 
County Administrative Building.  Although not a requirement, the agenda will also 
be posted on the County website at www.co.chaves.nm.us.  The IHC Coordinator 
shall also fax and/or e-mail copies of the written notice to those broadcast stations 
licensed by the Federal Communications Commission and newspapers of general 
circulation, which have made a written request for notice of public meetings. 

 
7. For the purpose of special meetings and emergency meetings described in 

paragraph 3 and 4 of this Resolution, notice requirements shall be met by posting 
notice of the date, time and place and agenda on the bulletin board located in the 
west hallway of the Chaves County Administrative Building.  The IHC office shall 
also fax copies of the written notice to those broadcast stations licensed by the 
Federal Communications Commission and newspapers of general circulation, 
which have made a written request for notice of public meetings. 

 
8. In addition to the information specified above, all notices shall include the 

following language: 
 
 If you are an individual with a disability who is in need of a reader, qualified sign 

language interpreter, or any form of auxiliary aid, or service to attend or 
participate in the hearing of a meeting, please contact the IHC Coordinator at 624-
6547.  This should be done at least one week prior to the meeting.   Public 
documents, including the agenda and minutes can be provided in various 
accessible formats.  Please contact the IHC Coordinator if a summary or other 
type of accessible format is needed. 

 
9.  A member of the Chaves County Indigent Hospital/Health Care Board may 

participate by telephone or other similar communications equipment when it is 
difficult or impossible for the Commissioner to attend the meeting in person, 
provided that the Commissioner can be identified when speaking, all participants 
are able to hear each other at the same time and members of the public attending 
the meeting are able to hear any member of the Commission. 

 
10. The IHC Board may close a meeting to the public only if the subject matter of such 

discussion or action is exempted from the open meeting requirements under Section 
10-15-1(H) of the Open Meetings Act. 

 
a. If any meeting is closed during an open meeting, such closure shall be 

approved by the majority vote of a quorum of the IHC Board taken during 
the open meeting.  The authority for the closure and the subject to be 
discussed shall be stated with reasonable specificity in the motion for 
closure and the vote on closure on each individual member shall be 



recorded in the minutes.  Only those subjects specified in the motion may 
be discussed in the closed meeting. 

 
b. If a decision to hold a closed meeting is made when the IHC Board is not in 

an open meeting, the closed meeting shall not be held until public notice, 
appropriate under the circumstances, stating the specific provisions of law 
authorizing the closed meeting and the subject to be discussed with 
reasonable specificity is given to the members and the general public. 

 
c. Following completion of any closed meeting, the minutes of the open 

meeting that was closed, or the minutes of the next open meeting if the 
closed meeting was separately scheduled, shall state whether the matters 
discussed in the closed meeting were limited only to those specified in the 
motion for notice for closure. 

 
d. Except as provided in Section 10-15-1(H) of the Open Meetings Act, any 

action taken as a result of discussions in the closed meetings shall be made 
by the vote of the IHC Board in an open public meeting. 

 
Passed this 15th day of January, 2015. 
 
 
      BOARD OF CHAVES COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 
 
 
      ______________________________________ 
      James W. Duffey, Member 
   
      ___________________________________ 
      Kyle D. “Smiley” Wooton, Member 
 
ATTEST:     ___________________________________ 
      Kim Chesser, Member 
 
      ___________________________________ 
_____________________   Robert Corn, Member 
Dave Kunko 
County Clerk     ___________________________________ 
      William E. Cavin, Member 



AGENDA ITEM: 3 Resolution R-15-003
Approval of Budget and Transfer

MEETING DATE: January 15, 2015 Adjustments

          STAFF SUMMARY REPORT

ACTION REQUESTED BY: Anabel Barraza, Senior Accountant

ACTION REQUESTED:
Approval of Resolution R-15-003

ITEM SUMMARY:

The Finance Department is requesting a budget adjustment for the restroom remodel in the
Chaves County Road Department. This project will be funded by fund 680- Restricted
Health Services and fund 401- Working Capital.

We are also requesting approval to increase the budget for the remainder of our audit fees
and for unemployment claims. 

Exhibit 'A' is attached indicating the increases to our budget.

Staff recommends approval.

SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:

Resolution R-15-0003
DFA Worksheet

SUMMARY BY: Anabel Barraza

TITLE: Senior Accountant



RESOLUTION R-15-003 
 

BUDGET AND TRANSFER ADJUSTMENTS 
 
 WHEREAS, at a regular meeting of the Board of Chaves County Commissioners held on 
January 15, 2015, the following was among the proceedings: 
 
 WHEREAS, the budget must be adjusted for fiscal year 2014-2015 expenditures and 
transfers; and, 
 
 WHEREAS, there are sufficient funds available for the budget adjustments; and, 
 
 WHEREAS, budget adjustments are necessary to ensure positive budget balances; and, 
 

WHEREAS, the Board of Chaves County Commissioners deems it necessary to adjust the FY 
14-15 Final Budget as designated in Exhibit ‘A’, attached. 
 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, THAT THE BOARD OF COUNTY 
COMMISSIONERS, CHAVES COUNTY, STATE OF NEW MEXICO, hereby approves the 
line item changes and requests approval from DFA Local Government Division for budget 
adjustments. 
 
 

 
Done at Roswell, New Mexico, this 15th day of January 2015. 
       
 
               BOARD OF CHAVES COUNTY  
               COMMISSIONERS 
 
 
      ________________________________ 
      James W. Duffey, Member 
   
      ________________________________ 
      Kyle D. “Smiley” Wooton, Member 
 
ATTEST:     ________________________________ 
      Robert Corn, Member 
 
      ________________________________ 
_____________________   Kim Chesser, Member 
Dave Kunko   
County Clerk     ________________________________ 
      William E. Cavin, Member 
  



   
 

EXHIBIT ‘A’ 

DFA Description   ACCOUNT                     AMOUNT                

299 Permanent Transfer  680-4-408-781-000       Decrease                <$50,745.55> 

300 Permanent Transfer  635-4-408-781-000       Increase                  $50,745.55 

300 Construction Projects  635-6-682-381-000       Increase     $140,000.00 

101 Professional Services  401-6-619-260-000       Increase      $13,000.00 

101 Property Admin Fee  401-6-619-277-000       Increase       $87,000.00 

101 Unemployment Claims  401-6-619-317-000       Increase       $38,000.00 

101 Tort Liability & Claims 401-6-619-313-000       Increase       $28,000.00 



Department of Finance and Administration
Local Government Division

Financial Management Bureau
SCHEDULE OF BUDGET ADJUSTMENTS

REVISED 12/08/06 For Local Government Division use only:

ENTITY NAME: Chaves County
FISCAL YEAR: 14-15
DFA Resolution Number:

(A) (B) (C) (D) (E) (F) (G)

REVENUE

ENTITY EXPENDITURE APPROVED ADJUSTMENT ADJUSTED

RESOULUTION FUND TRANSFER (TO or FROM) BUDGET BUDGET PURPOSE

NUMBER

RESOLUTION R-15-003 299 TRANSFER FROM $0 ($50,746) ($50,746) Funding needing for Restroom Remodel
RESOLUTION R-15-003 300 TRANSFER TO $825,000 $50,746 $875,746 Funding needing for Restroom Remodel
RESOLUTION R-15-003 300 EXPENDITURE $780,500 $140,000 $920,500 Restroom Remodel
RESOLUTION R-15-003 101 EXPENDITURE $16,001,087 $166,000 $16,167,087 Fees and Claim Line Items Adjustment

$0
$0
$0

 $0
$0
$0
$0
$0
$0
$0
$0
$0
$0
$0
$0

 $0
 $0
 $0
 $0
 $0
 $0
 $0
 $0
 $0
 $0
 $0
 $0
 $0

ATTEST: Chairman Thursday, January 15, 2015
Title (Date) Mayor/Board Chairman (Date)



AGENDA ITEM:         4              Resolution R-15-004 Declaring the intent of
Chaves County to Issue Industrial Revenue Bonds
on Behalf of Nextera Energy Resources, LLC 
                         

MEETING DATE: January 15, 2015

STAFF SUMMARY REPORT

______________________________________________________________________
ACTION REQUESTED BY: Stanton L. Riggs, County Manager

ACTION REQUESTED: Approve Resolution            
______________________________________________________________________

ITEM SUMMARY:

This resolution if approved, would begin the process whereby Chaves County would issue
30-year Industrial Revenue Bonds in an amount up to $290,000,000.00 on behalf of
Nextera Energy Resources, LLC, for a proposed solar farm in Chaves County.  Chaves
County is currently finalizing the PILOT (payments in lieu of taxes) funds which would be
paid over the entire life of the bonds.

No bonds shall be issued until the County Commission approves an ordinance authorizing
the issuance of the bonds.  This resolution is commonly referred to as an “inducement
resolution” and in no way obligates the County to any further action unless approved by the
County Commission.

Staff recommends approval.

_____________________________________________________________________

SUPPORT DOCUMENTS: Resolution R-15-004

_____________________________________________________________________

SUMMARY BY: Stanton L. Riggs

TITLE: County Manager
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RESOLUTION NO. _____ 

 
A RESOLUTION RELATING TO THE PROPOSED 
INDUSTRIAL REVENUE BONDS ENTITLED CHAVES 
COUNTY, NEW MEXICO TAXABLE INDUSTRIAL 
REVENUE BONDS (ROSWELL SOLAR, LLC, CHAVES 
COUNTY SOLAR, LLC, and CHAVES COUNTY SOLAR 
II, LLC PROJECTS), SERIES 2015A, SERIES 2015B, 
AND SERIES 2015C, AND DECLARING THE INTENT 
OF CHAVES COUNTY TO ISSUE SUCH INDUSTRIAL 
REVENUE BONDS IN AN AGGREGATE PRINCIPAL 
AMOUNT UP TO $290,000,000 IN CONNECTION WITH 
PROPOSED PROJECTS LOCATED WITHIN THE 
BOUNDARIES OF CHAVES COUNTY, NEW MEXICO, 
FOR THE PURPOSE OF INDUCING NEXTERA 
ENERGY RESOURCES, LLC TO DEVELOP THE 
PROJECT SITES AND TO CONSTRUCT AND INSTALL 
THE PROJECTS; AND DIRECTING THE COUNTY 
CLERK TO PUBLISH NOTICE OF INTENT TO 
CONSIDER AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING 
ISSUANCE AND SALE OF THE BONDS IN A 
NEWSPAPER OF GENERAL CIRCULATION WITHIN 
THE COUNTY. 

 
 WHEREAS, the New Mexico (“State”) legislature has passed the “County 
Industrial Revenue Bond Act” (the “Act”), Sections 4-59-1 to 4-59-16 inclusive, NMSA 
1978, as amended, which authorizes Chaves County, New Mexico (the “County”) to issue 
industrial revenue bonds and to acquire projects as defined in the Act; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the County desires to promote industry and develop trade by inducing 
manufacturing, industrial and commercial enterprises to locate in the County promoting 
the agricultural products and natural resources of the County and to secure and maintain a 
balanced and stable economy in the County and to promote public health, safety, security, 
and the general welfare of the citizens of the County; and 
 
 WHEREAS, NextEra Energy Resources, LLC, a Delaware limited liability 
company, made a proposal to the County (the “Proposal”) whereby the County will acquire 
from Roswell Solar, LLC, Chaves County Solar, LLC and Chaves County Solar II, LLC, 
each a limited liability company formed or to be formed by NextEra Energy Resources, 
LLC and to be authorized to do business in New Mexico (the “Companies”), leasehold title 
to land and fee title to equipment located in the County which will constitute industrial 
development projects (the “Projects”); and 
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 WHEREAS, the issuance of its industrial revenue bonds (the “Bonds”) by the 
County to finance the Projects will constitute one of the inducements whereby the 
Companies will determine to proceed with the Projects; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners (the “Commission”) of the 
County constitutes the governing body of the County within the meaning of the Act; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the Projects have been considered by the Commission and it has been 
concluded that the Projects will promote the health, safety, security, and general welfare of 
the citizens of the County, and the Commission desires to indicate its intent to consider 
proceeding with the issuance of the Bonds for the financing of the Projects; and 
 
 WHEREAS, concurrently with the issuance of the Bonds, the Companies will enter 
into installment sale, leasing or other financing agreements with the County under which 
the County will acquire the Projects and which will provide for the payment of installments, 
lease rentals or other payments by the Companies from the revenues generated by the 
Projects or other funds of the Companies sufficient to pay the debt service on the Bonds, 
subject to the prior adoption by the Commission of an ordinance approving such 
agreements and authorizing issuance of the Bonds (the “Bond Ordinance”); and 
 
 WHEREAS, the County and the Companies understand that the adoption of this 
Resolution shall not obligate the County to issue the Bonds except in full compliance with 
the terms of the Bond Ordinance to be considered for adoption by the Commission prior to 
the issuance of the Bonds and with the terms of the related bond documents; and 
 
 WHEREAS, Section 4-37-7 NMSA 1978, requires that publication of the title and 
general summary of this subject matter of any proposed ordinance be made in a newspaper 
of general circulation within the County at least two weeks prior to the meeting of the 
Board of County Commissioners at which the ordinance is proposed for final passage. 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY 
COMMISSIONERS, THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE COUNTY OF CHAVES, 
NEW MEXICO: 
 
 Section 1.  All actions (not inconsistent with the provisions hereof) heretofore taken 
by the Commission and the officers and employees of the County, related to the Proposal, 
the acquisition of the Projects, and the sale and issuance of the Bonds therefor, be and the 
same hereby are ratified, approved and confirmed. 
 
 Section 2.  The Commission understands that: 
 
  (A) The Projects will consist of land and equipment for solar 
photovoltaic electric generating facility, including solar tracking hardware and software; 
photovoltaic panels and inverters; support structures; transformers and associated electrical 
generating equipment used to generate electricity from solar energy; and related 
equipment; 
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  (B) The maximum aggregate face amount of industrial revenue bonds to 
be issued for the Projects is $290,000,000, or $120,000,000 each for the Series 2015A and 
Series 2015B Bonds, and $50,000,000 for the Series 2015C Bonds, each with a term of up 
to 30 years; 
 
  (C) The developer and operator of the Projects will be the Companies, 
or permitted successors or assignees; 
 
  (D) The location of the Projects’ proposed sites and boundaries in 
Chaves County are approximately 5-8 miles northeast of downtown of the City of Roswell, 
New Mexico; 
 

(E) The development, installation and operation of the Projects at the 
proposed sites are subject to land-use regulation or approval by the County or Extra 
Territorial Zone Planning Commission, as applicable; 

 
(F) The Companies will make all necessary arrangements with the 

proposed bond purchasers for the purchase of the Bonds and the County shall have no 
responsibility to make such arrangements; and 

 
  (G) The Companies have agreed to pay or reimburse the County for all 
legal counsel, including independent bond counsel, and financial advisory expenses of the 
County directly related to adoption of this Resolution, consideration and adoption of the 
Bond Ordinance and issuance of the Bonds.  The Companies have agreed to such payment 
or reimbursement irrespective of whether the Bonds are issued. 
 
 Section 3.  In order to promote the health, safety, security and general welfare of 
the citizens of the County, it is the Commission’s intent to take all necessary and advisable 
steps to consider and, if appropriate, to effect the issuance of the Bonds in an aggregate 
principal amount up to $290,000,000 in order to defray part or all of the costs of the 
Projects.  The Bonds are to be entitled substantially as follows: “Chaves County, New 
Mexico Taxable Industrial Revenue Bonds (Roswell Solar, LLC Project), Series 2015A,” 
“Chaves County, New Mexico Taxable Industrial Revenue Bonds (Chaves County Solar, 
LLC Project), Series 2015B,” and “Chaves County, New Mexico Taxable Industrial 
Revenue Bonds (Chaves County Solar II, LLC Project), Series 2015C.”  This expression 
of the Commission’s intent is subject to the provisions of Section 6 of this resolution and 
conditioned upon the issuance of the Bonds on or before December 31, 2016, or by such 
other deadline for issuance of the Bonds as may be provided by the Bond Ordinance or the 
documents executed and delivered in connection with issuance of the Bonds.   
 
 Section 4.  The Bonds shall be payable from the revenues of the Projects or other 
moneys payable by the Companies with respect thereto, and shall not constitute a debt or 
indebtedness of the County within the meaning of any provision or limitation of the 
Constitution or statutes of the State of New Mexico.  In addition, if the Bonds are issued, 
the Companies shall indemnify and hold harmless the County, the Commission and their 
respective officers, employees, designated representatives and agents (collectively, the 
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“Indemnified Persons”) from and against any liability to the Companies or to any third 
parties that may be asserted against the County with respect to the County’s ownership of 
or leasehold interest in the Projects or the issuance of the Bonds.  Nothing contained in this 
Resolution or in any other instrument shall be considered as obligating the County to any 
pecuniary liability or a charge upon the general credit of the County or against its taxing 
power, it being understood that no costs are to be borne by the County and that all costs 
incurred by the County in connection with the Bonds are to be promptly reimbursed by the 
Companies.  The County’s adoption of this Resolution shall not be deemed a conclusion 
or expression of approval by the County or any Indemnified Person of the Companies or 
the Projects. 
 
 Section 5.  The Companies, as agent for the County, will acquire the Projects.  For 
this purpose, by adoption of this Resolution, the County authorizes the Companies to act 
as agent for the County for the purchase of solar generation equipment used to generate 
electricity from solar and related equipment as defined in Section 7-9-54.3 NMSA 1978.  
For other tangible personal property relating to the Projects, the County will cooperate with 
the Companies to obtain and allow use of Type 9 Nontaxable Transaction Certificates 
(“Certificates”) that have been properly executed for acquisition of tangible personal 
property relating to the Projects as applicable under the New Mexico Gross Receipts and 
Compensating Tax Act.  The Companies shall not use the Certificates other than for such 
things as may be permitted by law, if any, nor shall the Companies use such Certificates 
after the completion of the Projects.  Prior to the use of such Certificates by the Companies 
as agent for the County, the County Manager and the Companies will agree to certain 
procedures regarding the use of the Certificates and protection of the County from any 
unpaid taxes determined to be due to the Taxation and Revenue Department.  No costs, 
expenses or other monetary relief will be recoverable from the County by vendors of solar 
generation equipment. 
 
 Section 6.  The County Commissioners and other appropriate County officials and 
employees are hereby authorized and empowered to take such steps and to do such things 
as may be necessary to achieve the purposes of this Resolution; provided, however, the 
issuance of the Bonds and the execution and delivery of any documents to which the 
County is a party in connection therewith shall be subject to the approval and authorization 
of the Commission pursuant to the Bond Ordinance, adopted following public notice of the 
Commission’s intent to adopt such Bond Ordinance at least fourteen (14) days prior to the 
consideration of the Bond Ordinance by the Commission at a public meeting, such public 
notice to specify the time, date and place of the Commission’s public hearing on the Bond 
Ordinance and the meeting at which the Bond Ordinance will be considered.  In particular, 
no provision of this Resolution shall in any way obligate the County or any other person to 
issue the Bonds, any other bonds or in any way finance the Projects; and the County retains 
full and complete discretion with respect thereto. 
 
 Section 7.   If Bonds are issued by the County, the documentation evidencing the 
obligations of the Companies shall provide that the Companies shall make annual payments 
in lieu of taxes to the County and to the Roswell Independent School District for so long 
as the Bonds are outstanding. 
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 Section 8.  This Resolution shall not give rise to a pecuniary liability of the County 
and shall not give rise to a charge against its general credit or taxing powers. 
 
 Section 9.  That the County Clerk is hereby directed, in accordance with Section 4-
37-7 NMSA 1978, as amended, to publish in the Roswell Daily Record, a newspaper of 
general circulation within the County, a title and general summary of the ordinance relating 
to and authorizing issuance of the Bonds at least two weeks prior to the meeting at which 
the County Commission will consider such ordinance.  The County Clerk may undertake 
such publication upon his own initiative and submittal of any necessary documents related 
to the proposed ordinance. 
 
 Section 10.  If any section, paragraph, clause or provision of this Resolution shall 
for any reason be held to be invalid or unenforceable, the invalidity or unenforceability of 
such section, paragraph, clause or provision shall not affect any of the remaining provisions 
of this Resolution. 
 
 Section 11.  All orders and resolutions, or parts thereof, in conflict with this 
Resolution are hereby repealed; provided, however, this repealer shall not be construed to 
revive any order, resolution or part thereof, heretofore repealed. 
 
 Section 12.  This Resolution shall take effect immediately upon its adoption and 
approval by the Commission. 
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PASSED, ADOPTED, SIGNED AND APPROVED this 15th day of January, 2015. 
 

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS, 
CHAVES COUNTY, NEW MEXICO 
 
        
James W. Duffey, Member 
 
        
Kim Chesser, Member 
 
        
Kyle D. “Smiley” Wooton, Member 
 
        
Robert Corn, Member 
 
        
William E. Cavin, Member 
 

 
 
 
[SEAL] 
ATTEST: 
 
________________________________ 
Dave Kunko, County Clerk 
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Item #        5          A. ITB-14-4 – Road Department Toilet Rooms  
 B. Agreement A-14-043 between Chaves   

County and RCC, LLC, dba Rivercrest  
Construction      

 
Meeting Date: 1-15-15 
  
 

STAFF SUMMARY 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
REQUESTED BY:   Tammy Brisco West, Purchasing Director 
 
ACTION REQUIRED:  Award ITB-4 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
SUMMARY: 
 
A. The following bids were received under ITB-14-4 for construction of toilet rooms for the 

Road Department: 
 
 BIDDER        BID 
  
 RCC LLC dba Rivercrest Construction, Albuquerque, NM  $137,000.00 
 
 Vantage Engineering and Construction Inc., Roswell, NM  $174,000.00 
 

Staff finds the low bid responsive to specifications and recommends award to Rivercrest 
Construction of Albuquerque.   

 
B. Agreement A-14-043 is the standard AIA Agreement form between Owner and 

Contractor for this project as specified through the specification book and plans issued 
under ITB-14-4. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:   Bid Summary, Agreement A-14-043 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
Submitted by: Tammy Brisco West 
Title: Purchasing Director



BID SUMMARY 
 

 
BID #: ITB-14-4 
 
COMMODITY: General Construction Services 
 
USER DEPARTMENT(S): Road Department 
 
SPECIFICATIONS BY: Donald Daugherty Architect 
 
ADVERTISED: November 9, 2014 in the Roswell Daily Record and online through the NM Purchasing 
Group, Public Purchase and the County’s website 
 
ADDENDA ISSUED: Two 
 
OPEN DATE: December 9, 2015 
 
SPECIFIC DESCRIPTION: This is a one-time invitation to bid for general construction services for 
construction of a restroom addition to the Chaves County Road Department facility.  The facility currently has 
bathrooms located at the east end of the building, which on the men’s side, include one stall and one urinal for 
over 40 men.   If awarded, the contractor will have 10 business days to supply the required bonds and 
certificates of insurance.  Once all documentation is received, a Notice to Proceed will be issued and 
construction will commence.  The job allows 180 days for project completion.   
 
 
 





















Item #       6           ITB-14-5 – One or more New Nissan and Toyota  
Passenger Vans      

  
Meeting Date: 1-15-15 
  

STAFF SUMMARY 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
REQUESTED BY:   Tammy Brisco West, Purchasing Director 
 
ACTION REQUIRED:  Award ITB-5 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
SUMMARY: 
 
The following bids were received under ITB-14-5 for one or more new, Nissan and Toyota 
Passenger Vans: 
 
BIDDER    BID ITEM 1  BID ITEM 2  OPTION 
     Nissan Van  Toyota Van  Auto Access Seat 

 
Casa Nissan, El Paso, TX  $36,705.00  No Bid   No Bid 
 
Roswell Nissan, Roswell, NM $39,470.00  No Bid   No Bid 
 
Roswell Toyota, Roswell, NM No Bid   $30,158.60  $35,192.84 
 
Funding for the purchase of these vans is through a grant received for the Vietnam Veterans 
Association in the amount of $199,000.00 for which Chaves County is the fiscal agent.   
 
Staff finds the low bid for Bid Item 1, submitted by Casa Nissan, to be non-responsive to 
specifications due to the type and amount of exceptions taken to specifications.  Staff further 
finds the second lowest bid on Bid Item 1 responsive to specifications and recommends award of 
Bid Item 1 to Roswell Nissan.  Staff finds the bid submitted for Bid Item 2 responsive to 
specifications and recommends award to Roswell Toyota.   
 
 
 
 
 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:   Bid Summary 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
Submitted by: Tammy Brisco West 
Title: Purchasing Director



BID SUMMARY 
 

 
BID #: ITB-14-5 
 
COMMODITY: Nissan NV3500 SL and Toyota Sienna LE passenger vans 
 
USER DEPARTMENT(S): Vietnam Veterans Association of SE New Mexico 
 
SPECIFICATIONS BY: Tammy Brisco West, Purchasing & Fire Services Director 
 
ADVERTISED: Online through the NM Purchasing Group, Public Purchase and the County’s website.  Direct 
notification made via phone and email to 16 individual dealerships across the state. 
 
ADDENDA ISSUED: None 
 
OPEN DATE: January 6, 2015 
 
SPECIFIC DESCRIPTION: This is a one-time invitation to bid for passenger vans for the Vietnam Veterans 
Association of SE NM.  The agency received grant funding through the State of NM in the amount of $199,000 
and Chaves County is the fiscal agent.  The agency anticipates purchasing one twelve passenger Nissan van and 
approximately 5 Toyota Sienna 7 passenger vans.  If awarded, the vehicles would be delivered within 15 to 45 
days after receipt of order, according to bids. 
 
 
 



AGENDA ITEM:         7              Election of Officers for 2015

                         

MEETING DATE: January 15, 2015

STAFF SUMMARY REPORT

ACTION REQUESTED BY: Stanton L. Riggs

ACTION REQUESTED: Elect Chairman and Vice-Chairman

ITEM SUMMARY:

In accordance with Ordinance #31, the Chaves County Board of Commissioners must elect
a Chairman and Vice-Chairman of the Commission for the year 2015.  The terms for these positions
are for one year and the elections will become effective January 15, 2015.

SUPPORT DOCUMENTS: N/A

SUMMARY BY: Stanton L. Riggs

TITLE: County Manager



AGENDA ITEM:         8              Permission to Publish for a Public Hearing 
Regarding Potential Low Income Tax  Rebate
Ordinance

                         

MEETING DATE: January 15, 2015

STAFF SUMMARY REPORT

ACTION REQUESTED BY: Stanton L. Riggs

ACTION REQUESTED: Permission to Publish

ITEM SUMMARY:

According to Section 7-2-14.3G, NMSA 1978, of every odd numbered year, the Board of
County Commissioners shall conduct a public hearing on the question of whether a property tax
rebate benefitting low income property tax payers in the County should be made available through
adoption of a County Ordinance.  At the public hearing, the Board shall take action on the question
and if a majority votes to adopt an ordinance, it must be adopted within 30 days of the public
hearing.  The public hearing would take place at 9:00 am on Thursday, February 19, 2015 in the
Commission Chambers.

Staff recommends approval for permission to publish for public hearing.

SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:

SUMMARY BY: Stanton L. Riggs

TITLE: County Manager







































































































































































































Purchasing Department 
Departmental Report 

January 2015 
 
ACTIVE BIDS AND RFPs: 
ITB-14-4 – Road Department Toilet Rooms Project – Opened December 9, 2014.  If awarded at January Commission 
meeting, anticipate construction starting the first of February and completing around the first of August. 
 
ITB-14-5 – One or More New Nissan and Toyota Vans – these vans are being solicited under a grant for the Vietnam 
Veterans Association of SE NM.   
 
UPCOMING LARGE PROCUREMENTS: 
 
Two Request for Information Proposals (RFI’s): One for Program Administrator for a Chaves County DWI Alternative 
Sentencing Program and the other for a Chaves County DWI Program Spanish Speaking Treatment Provider 
 
RFP for Professional engineering Design Services for the Hobson Road Project (Funded through appropriation) 
 
Bid for Viking Bunker gear  
 
Contract procurement for renovations to Omaha Road 
 
Contract procurements for SCBA Recharge Stations for District 8 and Sierra Fire Departments (Grant Funded) 
 
Procurements for a pump, foam proportioner, and forestry monitor for EGP Fire Department (Grant Funded) 
 
UPDATES: 
 
Automatic Control Systems (ACS) of Albuquerque is currently in the process of replacing all the HVAC controls at the 
Administration Center.   
 
Sierra Fire Station #4 – NMFA Funded Project – Project is 100% Complete.   
 
CENTRAL SUPPLY PROGRAM: 
 
Fiscal Year To Date (7-1-14 through 12-31-14) 
Total supply sales: $16,912.19 
Number of items issued: 1451 
 
Since July 23, 2012 (Program Inception) 
Total supply sales: $74,674.71 
Number of items issued: 6,390 
Number of registered users: 50 

 
PURCHASING CARD 

 
Number of Active Cards: 141  

 
Activity Fiscal Year to Date (FYTD): (7-1-2014 to 12-31-14) 
Debit: $1,117,024.75 Credit: $26,977.57 Net Card Spend Activity: $1,090,047.18 Total # of transactions: 2650 

 
Activity for December 2014 
Debit: $184,461.6 Credit: $1,559.63 Net Card Spend Activity: $182,902.04 Total # of transactions: 417 
 
COST SAVINGS MOMENTS OF MENTION 
 
A directive has been sent to all departments that County issued cell phones be used whenever feasible to make long 
distance phone calls, since long distance is free of charge on the cell phones, saving carrier fees.  The County currently 
spends approximately $4,500 annually on long distance charges.  






	Agenda 011515
	1
	A-15-001 Berrendo VFA Grant
	A-15-001 Berrendo VFA Grant Staff Summary 2

	2
	Staff Summary Public Meetings 2015
	R-15-001 Notice for Public Meetings
	R-15-002 Notice for IHC Public Meetings

	3
	Budget Increase R-15-003 Staff Summary
	RESOLUTION R-15-003
	Resolution R-15-003 DFA Worksheet

	4
	R-15-004 SS
	Inducement Resolution (1 7 15) (W2338146)

	5
	5
	2015_01_09_09_16_08

	6
	7
	8
	Checks
	2015_01_08_16_02_45
	2015_01_08_16_13_13
	2015_01_08_16_15_40

	Reports
	DOC010215
	Purchasing Report January 2015
	Sheriff's Report


