
CHAVES COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS 

REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING AGENDA 

May 18, 2017 –9:00 a.m. 

Chaves County Administrative Center – Joseph R. Skeen Building 

Commission Chambers - #1 St. Mary’s Place 
 

 

CALL TO ORDER 

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

DETERMINATION OF QUORUM 

APPROVAL OF MINUTES 

AGENDA ITEMS 

 
  

A. PUBLIC HEARINGS  

 

1. Public Hearing for Amendments to Ordinance O-060 Revision No. 1 Adopting 

the 2015 New Mexico Residential Building Code, the 2015 New Mexico 

Commercial Building Code, and the 2014 New Mexico Electrical Code. 

 

2. Public Hearing to obtain Public Input for the 2019/2023 Chaves County Infra-

Structure Capital Improvements Plan (ICIP) 

 

 

B. AGREEMENTS AND RESOLUTIONS  

 

3. A. Agreement A-17-011 Land Lease Agreement between Chaves County and 

Cellco Partnership d/b/a Verizon Wireless 

 

B. Resolution R -17-017 Authorizing the Chairman of the County Commission to 

Execute Any Documents Associated with Agreement A-17-011 Lease with Cellco 

Partnership d/b/a Verizon Wireless 

 

4. Resolution R-17-015 Approval to submit Juvenile Adjudication Fund Application 

FY 18 to DFA, Local Government Division 

 

5. Resolution R-17-016 Action Taken on All 2017 Requests for Road Maintenance 

and Road Vacation 

 

6. Resolution R-17-018 Approval of Budget Interim FY 17-18 

 

 

 

 



C. OTHER BUSINESS 

 

7. Permission to Publish for a Public Hearing Regarding Ordinance No. O-098. An 

Ordinance of Chaves County Adopting a County Gross Receipts Tax 

 

8. ITB-17-1-Inmate Supplies 

 

9. RFP-17-1-Audit Services 

 

10. ITB-17-2-General Construction: Tobosa Public Facility Addition 

 

11. RFP-17-2-Telephone Systems Equipment and Services 

 

 

 

APPROVAL OF CHECKS 

 

APPROVAL OF REPORTS 

 

UNSCHEDULED COMMUNICATIONS LIMITED TO THREE MINUTES PER 

VISITOR NO FORMAL ACTION TAKEN BY COMMISSION 

  

 COUNTY MANAGER’S COMMUNICATIONS 

 COMMISSIONER’S COMMUNICATIONS 

 SIGNATURE OF DOCUMENTS 

 ADJOURNMENT 
 
If you are an individual with a disability who needs a reader, qualified sign language interpreter, or any form of auxiliary aid or 
service to attend or participate in the hearing of a meeting, please contact the County Commissioner’s office at 575-624-6600.  
This should be done at least one week prior to the meeting.  Public documents, including the agenda and minutes, can be 
provided in various accessible formats.  Please contact the County Commissioner’s office if a summary or other type of 
accessible format is needed. 
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AGENDA ITEM: _______ Public Hearing to obtain Public Input 

for the 2019/2023 Chaves County 

Infra-Structure Capital Improvements 

Plan (ICIP).  

       

 

MEETING DATE: 7/19/2017  

 

STAFF SUMMARY 

 

 

Action Requested by: Georgianna Hunt, Community Development Division 

 

Action Requested: Public Hearing to obtain Public Input for the 2019/2023 ICIP Process.

  

 

 

Item Summary:  

 
Staff is requesting a Public Hearing for reporting on past Infrastructure Capital Improvements Plan activity and 
to receive public input on proposed Capital Outlay Improvements needs and suggestions for the Fiscal years 
2019– 2023. 
 
The local Infrastructure Capital Improvement Plan (ICIP) is a plan that established planning priorities for 
anticipated capital projects.  The need for this kind of planning has reached critical proportions in New Mexico, 
where local governments are faced with pressing demands for multiple capital improvements and limited 
funding to support them.  The state-coordinated local ICIP process encourages entities to plan for the 
development of capital improvements so that they do not find themselves in emergency situations, but can 
plan for, fund, and develop infrastructure at a pace that sustains their activities. 
 
Benefits of the ICIP include:  Encourages more efficient government operation, functions as a tool for 
community/citizen involvement, and provides a way for Entities and the public to cooperate and coordinate 
ideas.  The ICIP is a five-year plan designed to assist in providing a framework for decisions about community 
growth and development.  The ICIP focuses community/agency attention on priority goals, needs and 
capabilities while maximizing use of public funds on priority projects. 

 

 

 

SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:  2019/2023 Chaves County ICIP Summary.   
    

 

    

 

Summary by:  Georgianna Hunt               

 

Title:   Community Development Project Specialist  
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AGENDA ITEM: _______ R-17-016 Action Taken on All 2017 

Requests for Road Maintenance and Road 

Vacation 

 

  

        

MEETING DATE:       

 

 

STAFF SUMMARY REPORT 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

ACTION REQUESTED BY: Bill Williams, Public Services Director   

  

ACTION REQUESTED:                 Make Decisions on 2017 Road Applications 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

 

ITEM SUMMARY: 

 

  

The Chaves County Commission held a public hearing on road requests on April 20, 2017. The 

Commission reviewed and inspected the roads on April 24, 2017. At this point, the Commission 

needs to decide as to the disposition of the two road applications 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

_____________________________________________________________________________ 

 

SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:  Resolutions R-17-016  

____________________________________________________________________________ 

 

SUMMARY BY:  Bill Williams 

 

TITLE:   Public Services Director 
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Item #                  ITB-17-1 – Inmate Supplies    

 

Meeting Date:  5-18-2017 

  

 

STAFF SUMMARY 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

REQUESTED BY:   Sandra Rodriguez, Purchasing Director 

 

ACTION REQUIRED:  Award ITB-17-1 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

SUMMARY: 

 
The County has received bids from the following bidders under ITB-17-1 for Inmate Supplies.   

Staff has compared and evaluated bids on all items and recommends award be made to Bob 

Barker Company, Inc. 

   

 

Award of this bid will constitute a price agreement against which orders will be placed as 

needed.  The first term will be for a period of one year, with the option to renew for up to three 

additional one year terms.   

 

 

 

 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

 
SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:  Tabulation Sheet and Bid Summary 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

Submitted by: Sandra Rodriguez, CPO 

Title: Purchasing Director 
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Cham-Tex Goaltex Corp Bob Barker

Uniform 

Manufacturing 

Inc.

ICS Jail 

Supplies

, Inc.

OD 

TARAGIN & 

BROS, 

LLC

ACME 

SUPPLY 

CO.

AMERICAN 

PRODUCTS,I

NC

TABB 

TEXTILE 

CO,INC

STARR 

JANITORIAL 

INC.

Victory 

Supply, Inc.

7-30 days 14-30 days 7 days 7-30 days 7 days 30-45 days 7 days 7 days 7-15 days 7 days 7 days

√ x √ √ √ √ √ √ √ √

CATAGORY PRODUCT

BROWN No Bid No Bid 1.24$        No Bid  $   1.20  $        1.09 No Bid No Bid 1.31$          No Bid 1.05$           

20” X 40”

COZY 66 X 90 5.04$        $   5.40  $      11.45  $   6.60  $         5.65  $           5.34 

GREY WITH 

BLUE
No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid

COMB
5” BULK PACK 

2160/CS
0.02$        No Bid 0.02$        No Bid  $   0.02  No Bid No Bid 0.02$             No Bid No Bid 0.02$           

MAXIMUM 

SECURITY
0.25$        No Bid 0.23$        $   0.26  No Bid No Bid 0.25$             No Bid No Bid 0.26$           

.5 OZ. CLEAR  No Bid 

MATTRESS 

COVERS
WHITE No Bid No Bid 3.65$        No Bid  $   6.80  No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.90$          No Bid 12.00$         

HAND & BODY 0.06$        0.07$        $   0.04 0.04$             0.05$           

.25 OZ No Bid  No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

MATTRESS POLY MAT No Bid No Bid 52.96$      No Bid  $ 56.00  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54.00$         

BULK 0.05$        $   0.07 0.05$             0.13$               0.09$           

250/CS No Bid No Bid  No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid

TUMBLER

ORANGE FLEX 

TUMBLER 12 

OZ

No Bid No Bid 1.35$        No Bid  $   2.10  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NO BID

PEN

MAXIMUM 

SECURITY 

BLACK VINYL 

FLEX

0.10$        No Bid 0.09$        No Bid  $   0.13  No Bid No Bid 0.19$             No Bid No Bid 0.15$           

SINGLE BLADE 0.05$        No Bid 0.05$        $   0.05 0.05$             0.07$           

2000/CASE  No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

MAXIMUM 

SECURITY 
0.36$        No Bid 0.39$        No Bid  $   0.37  No Bid No Bid 0.45$             No Bid No Bid 0.41$           

4OZ CLEAR

SHOE

MENS ORANGE 

CANVAS STEP 

IN

3.39$        5.83$           3.29$        $             4.18  $   3.30  $        6.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.27$           

SANDAL
SANDAL 

ORANGE
No Bid No Bid 1.69$        $   2.25  $        6.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.27$           

CREW 0.40$        $             0.41  $   0.46  $        0.57  $   0.35 0.45$           

WHITE 0.45$        No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

POLYPROPYLE

NE
0.07$        $   0.37 0.12$           

ORANGE 

144/CS
No Bid No Bid  No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

SHORT 

HANDLE
0.04$        0.04$        $   0.04  No Bid 0.05$             No Bid 0.04$           

144/CS No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid

MAXIMUM 

SECURITY
0.13$        No Bid 0.17$        No Bid  $   0.15 0.13$             No Bid No Bid 0.19$           

.85 OZ. CLEAR  No Bid No Bid

TRISTICH 5.90$        No Bid 3.88$        $             4.15  $   7.95 
 S-XL   7.57     

3X 7.84 
 $   5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid S-2X 4.67

NAVY

TRISTITCH 5.90$        No Bid 3.98$        $             4.80  $   7.95  4X 8.00  $   5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3-4X 5.04

ORANGE

TRISTITCH 5.90$        3.98$        $             4.80  $   7.95  5X 8.87  $   5.00 No Bid No Bid 5X 5.24

RED No Bid No Bid

UNIFORM 

TROUSERS

TRISTITCH 

NAVY
6.54$        No Bid 4.69$        $             5.25  $   7.95  S-2XL 7.84  $   5.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid S-2X 4.98

UNIFORM 

TROUSERS

TRISTITCH 

ORANGE
6.54$        No Bid 5.29$        $             5.43  $   7.95  3X 8.65  $   5.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2-4X 5.19

UNIFORM 

TROUSERS

TRISTITCH 

RED
6.54$        No Bid 5.29$        $             5.43  $   7.95  4-5X 9.03  $   5.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5X- 5.44

UNIFORM 

SHIRT

UNIFORM 

SHIRT

Delivery Time Frame

Credit Card Accepted

SHAMPOO

SOCKS

SPORK

TOOTHBRUSH

TOOTHPASTE

UNIFORM 

SHIRT

BATH TOWEL

BLANKET

DEODORANT

LOTION

MAXITHINS 

PADS

RAZOR

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



BID SUMMARY 

 

BID #: ITB-17-1 

 
COMMODITY:  Inmate Supplies 

 

USER DEPARTMENT(S):  Detention Centers 

 
SPECIFICATIONS BY:  Sandra Rodriguez, Purchasing Director 

 

ADVERTISED: April 2, 2017 in the Roswell Daily Record and online through the NM 

Purchasing Group and Chaves County Web page. 

 
ADDENDA ISSUED: One. 

 

OPEN DATE: April 19, 2017. 

 

SPECIFIC DESCRIPTION: Award of this bid will serve as a price agreement for all orders 

placed for an initial one year period with the option to renew for up to three additional one year 

terms.   

 

 



 

 

 

Item #                      RFP-17-1 – Audit Services    

  

Meeting Date:  05/18/2017 

STAFF SUMMARY 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

REQUESTED BY:   Sandra Rodriguez, Purchasing Director 

ACTION REQUIRED:  Award RFP-17-1       

______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

SUMMARY:  

 

The County solicited proposals for RFP-17-1 Professional Audit Services.  Following are the 

companies that submitted and final committee scores:   

 

Agency      Total 

 

Jaramillo Accounting Group (JAG)   91.75 

Hinkle + Landers, PC     89 

Burt & Company CPAs, LLC    84 

Cordova CPAs LLC     82.50 

RPC CPAs + Consultants, LLP   82 

Beasley, Mitchell & Co., LLP    72 

Atkinson & Co.     70.25 

Griego Professional Services    69.75 

 

 

Staff recommends award be made to highest ranking offeror, Jaramillo Accounting Group, LLC.  

State Auditor has approved request and contract for Jaramillo Accounting Group, LLC to conduct 

the Fiscal Year 2017 annual audit for Chaves County. 

 

 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:   RFP Summary 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

Submitted by: Sandra Rodriguez, CPO 

Title:   Purchasing Director 
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RFP SUMMARY 

 

 

RFP #: RFP-17-1 

 

COMMODITY: Audit Services 

 

USER DEPARTMENT(S): Administration 

 

SPECIFICATIONS BY: Sandra Rodriguez, Purchasing Director 

 

ADVERTISED: April 2, 2017 in the Roswell Daily Record, also distributed online via the New 

Mexico Purchasing Group and Chaves County Web page.  

 

ADDENDA ISSUED: None. 

 

OPEN DATE: April 19, 2017 

 

SPECIFIC DESCRIPTION:  This is a routine RFP for Audit Services for the County.  The 

specifications and evaluation criteria are set forth by the NM State Auditor’s office.    

 

Total
Technical 

Experience

Capability of the 

firm

Work Requirements 

& Audit Approach

Cost – a breakdown 

of hours and total 

cost in the 

categories of 

Financial 

Statements Audit, 

Federal Single 

Audit, Financial 

Statement 

    Preparation, CAFR

Firm Strengths and 

Weaknesses

Supplier / 100 pts / 40 pts / 30 pts / 15 pts / 10 pts / 5 pts

Jaramillo Accounting 

Group (JAG)
91.75 pts 37.75 pts 27 pts 13.75 pts 8.25 pts 5 pts

Hinkle + Landers, PC 89 pts 36.5 pts 27.5 pts 13.75 pts 6.5 pts 4.75 pts

Burt & Company 

CPAs, LLC
84 pts 36 pts 25.75 pts 11 pts 9 pts 2.25 pts

Cordova CPAs LLC 82.5 pts 34 pts 23.25 pts 13.5 pts 8.25 pts 3.5 pts

RPC CPAs + 

Consultants, LLP
82 pts 35.75 pts 24.75 pts 11.25 pts 6.5 pts 3.75 pts

Beasley, Mitchell & 

Co., LLP
72 pts 28 pts 23.75 pts 11.5 pts 5.25 pts 3.5 pts

Atkinson & Co. 70.25 pts 29.25 pts 20.75 pts 10 pts 5.75 pts 4.5 pts

Griego Professional 

Services
69.75 pts 27.5 pts 21.75 pts 10.75 pts 8 pts 1.75 pts

 



Item #                    ITB-17-2– General Construction: Tobosa Public 

Facility Addition  

 

Meeting Date: 05/18/2017 

STAFF SUMMARY 

__________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

REQUESTED BY:   Sandra Rodriguez, Purchasing Director 

ACTION REQUIRED:  A. Award ITB-17-2 B. Agreement signatures 

__________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

SUMMARY: The following bids were received under ITB-17-2 for a new building for Tobosa Developmental 

Services located at 110 E. Summit St. Roswell, NM 88203: 

 

       BIDDER             BID      
      

Rhoads Co.      $488,271.00 

 Roswell, NM 

 

Western Builders Co. Inc.    $439,000.00   

 Las Cruces, NM 

 

 

Authorization for project to proceed after these documents are approved is contingent upon DFA review and 

approval.  

 

The funding for this project is through CDBG grant 15-C-NR-I-03-G-11, available allocations total $480,000.00. 

Staff finds the low bid responsive to specifications and therefore recommends award to Western Builders Co. Inc. in 

the amount of $439,000.00 plus applicable gross receipts tax.  

 

Staff also requests that the board authorize the Chairman to execute the grant agreement when received as well as 

the agreement between Owner and Contractor in order to stream line the process and prevent funding for this project 

from reverting back to the Federal Government. 

__________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:  Bid Summary/Letter of Recommendation/Agreement between Owner and 

Contractor. 

__________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

Submitted by: Sandra Rodriguez, CPO 

Title:   Purchasing Director 
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BID SUMMARY 

 

 

BID #: ITB-17-2 

 

COMMODITY: Building Addition  

 

USER DEPARTMENT(S): Tobosa Developmental Services 

 

SPECIFICATIONS BY: Hal Barnett, Architect 

 

ADVERTISED: April 14 and 16, 2017 in the Roswell Daily Record and posted on the Chaves County Web page. 

 

ADDENDA ISSUED: Two 

 

OPEN DATE: May 4, 2017 

 

SPECIFIC DESCRIPTION: This is a one-time bid for the construction of a new 1632 sf building, plus the add on 

alternate bringing the total to 1887 sf.  The site for placement is located at 110 E Summit St, Roswell, NM 88203.  The 

building is intended for use as a multi-purpose great room for handicapped clients.  Improvements will consist of 

earthwork; site concrete; expansion structure and foundation; framing; gypsum board; painting; wall finishes; toilet 

compartments; stucco; roofing; room signage; new flooring; ceiling tile; windows; electrical; plumbing; and HVAC. 

All work shall comply with the current ADA standards for accessible design and comply with the federal, state and 

local building codes. 



 
                                             2600 N. Main St., Suite B 

                                                        Roswell, New Mexico 88201 
                                            Phone (575) 622-9858 

                                                        Fax (575) 627-0057 
 

 

BID TABULATION SHEET 

PROJECT: TOBOSA PUBLIC FACILITY ADDITION 
  

OWNER: CHAVES COUNTY 
 

 

CDBG PROJECT NO.: 15-C-NR-I-03-G-11          
 

 

BID TIME AND DATE: 3:00 PM,  MAY 4, 2017 
 

 

 
 
 

CONTRACTOR: 
B

id
 B

o
n
d

 

A
g

e
n

ts
 A

ff
id

a
v
it
 

S
u

b
c
o

n
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a
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r 
L
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ti
n

g
 

C
e
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f 
B
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r 

E
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u
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m
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p

p
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e
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T
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u
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o

n
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a
c
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B
re

a
k
d

o
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n
 

T
a
b

le
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W
o

rk
fo

rc
e
 B

re
a
k
d

o
w

n
 

A
c
k
. 

A
d

d
. 

#
 1

 

A
c
k
. 

A
d

d
. 

#
 2

. 

  

 
 
 
 

BASE BID 

 
 
 
 
 

ADD. ALT. #1 
 

TOTAL BID 
 

Mick Rich Contractors 
Albuquerque/Carlsbad, NM 
            

         
NO BID RECEIVED 
 

 

  

Rhoads Co. 
Roswell, NM 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
  

$ 459,995.00 
 

   
 
$  28,276.00 
 

$ 488,271.00 
 

Waide Construction Co. Inc. 
Roswell, NM 
 

 
                     

         

    
NO BID RECEIVED 
 

 

  

 
Western Builders, LLC 
Las Cruces, NM 
 

  

 

  
 

  
 

  
 

  
 

 
  

 
  

  
 

 
  

  
  

$ 412,500.00  

 

 
 
$  26,500.00 
 

$ 439,000.00 
 

                                                                                                                

 

                         
Certified by:           
                         Hal E. Barnett, Architect 
       
                       

5/5/17 



 

 

 
 
May 9, 2017 
 
Board of Commissioners 
c/o Sandra Rodriguez, Purchasing Agent         
Chaves County 
#1 St. Mary’s Place 
Roswell, New Mexico  88203 
 
Re: Tobosa Public Facility Addition 
 ITB No. 17-2 
 CDBG Project No. 15-C-NR-I-03-G-11 
  
Dear Commissioners,  
 
On Thursday, May 4, 2017 two sealed bids were opened for the above referenced project.  Enclosed 
please find a copy of the certified Bid Tabulation Sheet listing these bids. 
 
Western Builders, LLC from Las Cruces, NM submitted the low responsive bid.  In our review of their 
bid documents we found everything to be in compliance.  Western Builders will be subcontracting with 
Roswell area contractors for the plumbing, HVAC, electrical, and flooring.  Western Builders has been 
engaged in the contracting business under this name for four (4) years.  They have completed a 
number of projects over this time period.  Two of these were renovation projects for NMSU in Las 
Cruces.  ASA was the architect for one of them, which was a challenging one which had a short time 
period to be constructed, but Western did a good job and completed it on time.  NMSU was also quite 
pleased with Western Builders’ performance on the previous project they were the general contractor 
for. 
 
Western Builders total bid including Add Alternate No. 1 after adding NM gross receipts tax is 
approximately $9,000 below the available Maximum Allowable Construction Cost (MACC).   Therefore, 
ASA Architects recommends the County of Chaves award a construction contract for the Base Bid and 
Add Alternate No. 1 plus NMGR tax totaling $472,748.13, contingent upon DFA approval.  
 
Attached is a copy of the Agreement Between Owner and Contractor which has been sent to the 
Contractor for his signature, which will be provided in three (3) counterparts for County signatures after 
the Commission meeting on May 18. 
 
Sincerely, 
 

 
Hal E. Barnett, A.I.A 
Vice President 
 
cc: Dora Batista, SNMEDD Council of Governments 
 
Enclosures 
 
HEB/jeb  

 



  

                    AGREEMENT BETWEEN OWNER AND CONTRACTOR  
  

AGREEMENT FORMS - LUMP SUM PRICE OR UNIT PRICE  
  Section 00510  

                                                                                                        Contract No.   A-17-010  

  
  

  

  

  
Distribution to:  

 Owner   

 Contractor   
 Architect/Engineer   
 Finance Dept.  
 CDBG Project Manager  

  
  

 

  

 [Disclaimer:  Changes and/or modifications made to this document, other than the typical construction items for which 

the contractor is bidding and/or will contract for, without the written consent of the Local Government Division, DFA 

shall render this document null and void]  

  

 This Agreement entered into this Eighteenth day of May, 2017, by and between the parties as follows:            

  

THE OWNER:    THE CONTRACTOR:  

Chaves County   Western Builders, LLC 

#1 Saint Mary’s Place   225 E. Idaho #30 

Roswell, NM  88203   Las Cruces, NM  88005 

    

Telephone: 575-624-6600  Telephone: (575) 449-8222   

Fax:  575-624-6631 Fax: (575) 541-5657   

E-mail address: purchasing@co.chaves.nm.us        E-mail address: steven@westernbuildersnm.com 

 
   

For the following Project:  TOBOSA PUBLIC FACILITY ADDITION 

110 E. SUMMIT AVE.  

ROSWELL, NM   88203  

  

Project Number:  CDBG-15-C-NR-I-03-G-11 

 

ARCHITECT/ENGINEER OR RECORD: 

ASA Architects  

2600 N. Main St., Suite B  

Roswell, NM   88201  

Telephone:  575-622-9858  

Fax:  575-627-0057  

E-mail address: hal@asa-architects.com  
 

 

Rev 6-16    



  

RECITALS  ARTICLE 2  

WHEREAS, New Mexico Small Cities Community   THE WORK  

Block Grant; and   

  

WHEREAS, the Owner, through its Mayor/  

Chairman, is authorized to enter into a construction 

contract for the Project pursuant to Sections  

13-1-100 NMSA 1978; and   

  

WHEREAS, the Owner has let this contract 

according to the established state and local 

purchasing procedures for contracts of the type and 

amount let; and  

  

WHEREAS, award of the construction contract on 

this Project was approved by the Governing Body 

at its meeting of May 18, 2017;  

  

The OWNER and the CONTRACTOR agree as set 

forth below.  

  

ARTICLE 1 THE CONTRACT DOCUMENTS  

 1.1 The Contract Documents consist of the 

following:  

  

 Bid Form  

 This Agreement  

 Performance Bond         

 Labor and Material Payment Bonds  

 Agent's Affidavit  

 Certificate of Insurance  

 Assignment of Antitrust Claims  

 Table A Subcontracts Breakdown  

 Table B Estimated Project Workforce 

Breakdown  

 Notice of Award  

 Notice to Proceed  

 Conditions of the Contract (General,  

 Supplementary and Other Conditions)  

 Drawings  

 Specifications  

 All Addenda Issued Prior to and   

 All Modifications Issued after Execution of this 

Agreement  

 Federal requirements, certifications and forms 

required by the CDBG program  

  

These documents form the Contract, and all are as 

fully a part of the Contract as if attached to this  

Agreement or repeated herein. An enumeration of the 

Contract Documents appears in Article 7 of this  

Agreement.    

2.1 The Contractor shall perform all the Work required 

by the Contract for the following:  

  

Chaves County at Latitude 33.383218700 and 

Longitude 104.521435500 will plan, design and 

construct an addition to an existing facility, located in 

Roswell, NM.  The addition will consist of an expansion 

of approximately 1,630 sq. ft.  Improvements will 

consist of earthwork; site concrete; expansion structure 

and foundation; framing; gypsum board; painting; wall 

finishes; toilet compartments; stucco; roofing; room 

signage; new flooring; ceiling tile; windows; electrical; 

plumbing; and HVAC.  All work shall comply with the 

current ADA standards for accessible design and 

comply with the federal, state and local building codes.  
  

ARTICLE 3 TIME OF COMMENCEMENT AND 

SUBSTANTIAL COMPLETION  

  

3.1 The Work to be performed under the contract shall 

commence not later than ten (10) consecutive calendar 

days after the date of written Notice to Proceed. 

Substantial Completion shall be achieved not later than 

One Hundred Eighty (180) consecutive calendar days 

after the date of written Notice to Proceed, except as 

hereafter extended by valid written Change Order by 

the Owner.  

  

3.2 Should the Contractor neglect, refuse, or otherwise 

fail to complete the Work within the time specified in 

this article, the Contractor agrees, in partial 

consideration for the award of the Contract, to pay to 

the Owner the amount of Three Hundred Dollars 

($300.00) per consecutive calendar day, not as a 

penalty, but as liquidated damages for such breach of 

the Contract.  

  

ARTICLE 4 CONTRACT SUM  

  

4.1 The Owner shall pay the Contractor in current 

funds for the performance of the Work, subject to 

additions and deductions by Change Order as provided 

in the Contract, the Contract Sum of Four Hundred 

Seventy-two Thousand Seven-Hundred Forty-eight 

Dollars and Thirteen Cents ($ 472,748.13). 
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4.2 The Contract sum is determined as follows: 

 

Base Bid $ 412,500.00 

Additive Alternate No. 1* $   26,500.00 

Subtotal $ 439,000.00 

NM GRT @ 7.6875 % $   33,748.13 

Total Contract Sum $ 472,748.13 

 

* Additive Alternate No.1 consists of increasing the 

floor area of the new building 255 sq. ft., to make a 

1,887 sq. ft. building, as shown on the Drawings. 

 

ARTICLE 5 

PROGRESS PAYMENTS 

 

5.1 Based upon Applications for Payment submitted 

to the Architect/Engineer by the Contractor and 

Certificates for Payment issued by the Architect/ 

Engineer, the Owner shall make progress payments 

on account of the Contract Sum to the Contractor as 

provided in the Contract for the period ending the 

5th day of the month as follows: 

 

5.2 Not later than twenty-one (21) working days 

following receipt by the Owner of an undisputed  

Application for Payment or as stated in Paragraph 

25 of the Supplemental General Conditions, one 

hundred percent (100%) of the portion of the 

Contract Sum properly allocable to labor, materials, 

and equipment incorporated in the Work and one 

hundred percent (100%) of the portion of the 

Contract Sum properly allocable to materials and 

equipment suitably stored at the site or some other 

location agreed upon in writing for the period 

covered by the Application for Payment, less the 

aggregate of previous payments made by the Owner; 

less such amounts as the Architect/ Engineer shall 

determine for all incomplete Work and unsettled 

claims as provided in the Contract Documents 

(Section 57-28-5 NMSA 1978).  

 

5.2.1 When making payments, an owner, 

contractor or subcontractor shall not retain, 

withhold, hold back or in any other manner not pay 

amounts owed for work performed. For additional 

information regarding retainage and the Prompt 

Payment Act refer to Section 57-28-5 NMSA 1978. 

 

ARTICLE 6 

FINAL PAYMENT 

 

6.1 Final payment, constituting the entire unpaid 

balance of the Contract Sum, shall be paid by the 

Owner to the Contractor within thirty (30) calendar 

days after notification of the Owner by the 

Architect/Engineer that all incomplete and 

unacceptable work that was noted during the 

Substantial Completion Inspection and listed on the 

attachment to the Certificate of Substantial Completion 

has been corrected, and provided the Contract has been 

fully performed and a final Certificate for Payment has 

been issued by the Architect/Engineer and final 

monitoring and close-out by the Funding Agency. In 

addition, the Contractor shall provide to the Owner a 

certified statement of Release of Liens (AIA Document 

G706A or approved form) and Consent of Surety. 

 

ARTICLE 7 

GENERAL AND SPECIAL PROVISIONS 

 

7.1 This Agreement shall be governed exclusively by the 

provisions hereof and by the laws of the State of New 

Mexico as the same from time to time exist. 

 

7.2 Terms used in this Agreement that are defined in 

the Conditions of the Contract shall have the meanings 

designated in those Conditions. 

 

7.3 As between the parties to this Agreement. As to all 

acts or failures to act by either party to this Agreement, 

any applicable statue of limitations shall commence to 

run and any alleged cause of action shall be deemed to 

have accrued in any and all events not later than the 

relevant Date of Substantial Completion of the Work; 

and as to any acts or failures to act occurring after the 

relevant Date of Substantial Completion, not later than 

the date of the Owner's approval of the Final Certificate 

of Payment.   

 

7.4 The Contractor shall hold harmless and indemnify 

the Owner against any and all injury, loss, or damage, 

including cost of defense - including but not limited to 

court costs and attorneys' fees - arising out of the 

negligent acts, errors, or omissions of the Contractor. 

 

7.5 This Agreement shall not become effective until 

approved by the governing body; and signed by all 

parties required to sign this Agreement and reviewed 

by the Funding Agency. 

 

7.6 The Contractor and his agents and employees are 

independent contractors and are not employees of the 

Owner. The Contractor and his agents and employees 

shall not accrue leave, retirement, insurance, bonding, 

use of Owner vehicles, or any other benefits afforded to 

employees of the Owner as a result of this Agreement. 

 

7.7 The Contractor, upon final payment of the amounts 

due under this Agreement, releases the Owner, his 
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officers and employees from his liabilities and 

obligations arising from or under this Agreement, 

including but not limited to all damages, losses, 

costs, liability, and expenses, including but not 

limited to attorneys' fees and costs of litigation that 

the Contractor may incur. 

 

7.8 The Contractor agrees not to purport to bind 

Owner to any obligation not assumed herein by 

Owner unless the Contractor has express written 

authority to do so, and then only within the strict 

limits of that authority. 

 

7.9 Notices. All notices herein provided to be given, 

or which may be given, by either party to the other 

shall be deemed to have been fully given when 

made in writing and deposited in the United States 

mail, postage prepaid - in the instance of notice of 

termination of work also by certified mail - and 

addressed as shown on the title page of this 

Agreement. 

 

7.10 Nothing herein contained shall preclude the 

giving of any such written notice by personal 

service.  The address to which notices shall be 

mailed to either party may be changed by written 

notice given by such party to the other as 

hereinabove provided. 

 

7.11 Gender - Singular/Plural.  Words of any 

gender used in this Agreement shall be held and 

construed to include any other gender, and words in 

the singular number shall be held to include the 

plural, unless the context requires otherwise. 

 

7.12 Captions and Section Headings.  The captions 

and section headings contained in this Agreement 

are for convenience of reference only, and in no way 

limit, define, or enlarge the terms, scope, and 

conditions of this Agreement. 

 

7.13 This document shall be executed in no less 

than three (3) counterparts, each of which shall be 

deemed an original. 

 

7.14 Certificates and Documents Incorporated. All 

certificates and documentation required by the 

provisions of this Agreement shall be attached to 

this Agreement at the time of execution and are 

hereby incorporated by reference as though set forth 

in full in this Agreement to the extent they are 

consistent with its conditions and terms. 

 

7.15 Separability.  If any clause or provision of this 

Agreement is illegal, invalid, or unenforceable under 

present or future laws effective during the term of this 

Agreement, then and in that event it is the intention of 

the parties hereto that the remainder of this Agreement 

shall not be affected thereby. 

 

7.16 Waiver.  No provision of this Agreement shall be 

deemed to have been waived by either party unless 

such waiver be in writing signed by the party making 

the waiver and addressed to the other party; nor shall 

any custom or practice which may evolve between the 

parties in the administration of the terms hereof be 

construed to waive or lessen the right of either party to 

insist upon performance by the other party in strict 

accordance with the terms hereof.  Further, the waiver 

by any party of a breach by the other party of any term, 

covenant, or condition hereof shall not operate as a 

waiver of any subsequent breach of the same or any 

other term, covenant, or condition thereof. 

 

7.17 Entire Agreement. This Agreement represents the 

entire contract between the parties and, except as 

otherwise provided herein, may not be amended, 

changed, modified, or altered without the written 

consent of the parties hereto.  This Agreement 

incorporates all of the conditions, agreements, and 

understandings between the parties concerning the 

subject matter of this Agreement, and all such 

conditions, understandings, and agreements have been 

merged into this written Agreement.  No prior 

condition, agreement, or understanding, verbal or 

otherwise, of the parties or their agents shall be valid or 

enforceable unless embodied in this written Agreement. 

 

7.18 Interchangeable Terms.  For purposes of all 

provisions within this Agreement and all attachments 

hereto, the terms "Agreement" and "Contract" shall 

have the same meaning and shall be interchangeable. 

 

7.19 Words and Phrases.  Words, phrases, and 

abbreviations which have well-known technical or trade 

meanings used in the Contract Documents shall be used 

according to such recognized meanings.  In the event of 

a conflict, the more stringent meaning shall govern.      

 

7.20 Relationship of Contract Documents.  The 

Contract Documents are complementary, and any 

requirement of one contract document shall be as 

binding as if required by all. 

 

7.21 Pursuant to §13-1-191 NMSA 1978, reference is 

hereby made to the criminal laws of New Mexico, 

including §§30-14-1, 30-24-2, and 30-41-1 through 3 

NMSA 1978, which prohibit bribes, kickbacks, and 

gratuities, violation of which constitutes a felony.  

Further, the Procurement Code, §§13-1-28 through 
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13-1-199 NMSA 1978, imposes civil and criminal 

penalties for its violation. 

 

7.22 The Contract Documents, which constitute the 

entire Contract between the Owner and the 

Contractor, are listed in Article 1 and, except for 

Modifications issued after execution of this 

Agreement, are enumerated as follows: 

 

7.23 The following documents bound in the Project 

Manual: 
 

Documents      Pages 

Bid Form     4A-25 

Agreement between Owner 

    and Contractor   4A-43 

Performance Bond   4A-49 

Labor and Material Payment Bond 4A-53 

Agent's Affidavit                                      4A-58 

 

Certificate of Insurance   4A-61 

Assignment of Antitrust Claims  4A-62 

Table A Subcontracts Breakdown            4A-64 

Table B Estimated Project Workforce      4A-65 

Breakdown 

General Conditions   4A-67 

Supplementary Conditions  4A-81 
 

Technical Specifications - Division 1-33

 

 

Approved by the Governing Body at its meeting of May 18, 2017  

 

OWNER: Chaves County   

    

  Date:  

 (Signature) Chairperson   

Reviewed:    

 As to Legal Form and Sufficiency   

    

By:    

 

Title: 

  

Date: 

 

    

 As to Budget Sufficiency   

 

By: 

   

 

Title: 

   

Date: 

 

    

APPROVED:  This Agreement is entered into as of the day and year first written above. 

 

CONTRACTOR: Western Builders, LLC   

    

By:    

 

Title: 

(Signature) Steven Preece 

President 
 

Date: 

 

 

Federal Tax ID No:  38-3899565 State Tax ID No: 03-265986-005 

 

AGENCY CONCURRENCE: 

 

By: 

   

 

Title: 

  

Date: 

 

____________________ 

   

 

 

 



Item #                  RFP-17-2 – Telephone Systems Equipment 

and Services                                            

Meeting Date:  05/18/2017 

 

STAFF SUMMARY 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

REQUESTED BY:   Sandra Rodriguez, Purchasing Director 

 

ACTION REQUIRED:  A. Award RFP-17-2  

______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

SUMMARY:  Chaves County solicited proposals for RFP-17-2 Telephone Systems Equipment 

and Services. Following are the companies that submitted and final committee scores: 

 

OFEROR         TOTAL 
 

Harmonix Technologies       87.33 

Linehan Communications Inc.      87.17 

CamNet, Inc.         85.00 

Newbridge Business Solutions LLC            68.50  

Altura Communication Solutions       63.33 

Technologent                 62.67 

IPitimi          62.33 

 

 

In fiscal year 15-16 Chaves County spent $150,184.55 on equipment, phones, long distance and 

service.  Our new contract with Harmonix Technologies will have all in one service (equipment, 

phones, long distance, etc) for $60,000.00 per year. Total savings of over $90,000.00 per year.  

 

Staff recommends award be made to highest ranking offeror, Harmonix Technologies for provision 

of a new cloud based voice over internet protocol (VoIP) telephone system for Chaves County.  If 

awarded, a contract will be negotiated and anticipated to be brought back before the commission 

at its next regular meeting.   

 

 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:   RFP Summary 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Submitted by: Sandra Rodriguez, CPO 

Title: Purchasing Director 

 

 

aklein
Typewritten Text

aklein
Typewritten Text
11



 

 

  

RFP SUMMARY 

 

 

RFP #: RFP-17-2 

 
COMMODITY: Telephone Systems Equipment and Services 

 

USER DEPARTMENT(S): Multiple 

 
SPECIFICATIONS BY: Alfredo Garcia, IT Director 

 

ADVERTISED: April 2, 2017 in the Roswell Daily Record, also distributed online via the NM 

Purchasing Group and Chaves County Web page.  

 
ADDENDA ISSUED: One. 

 

OPEN DATE: April 19, 2017 

 

SPECIFIC DESCRIPTION:  This is a request for proposals for a comprehensive new cloud 

based phone system for the County.  This will be a “turn key” operation using a cloud based system 

utilizing the current Chaves County infrastructure. The scope includes a provision for cost 

effective telecommunications systems advantageous to the county in meeting the future 

challenges.  The new system would replace the current system being used in several county 

locations, including the Administration Center, Adult Detention, Road Department, Maintenance 

Department, Juvenile Detention Center, Fire Department stations and several locations within the 

Courthouse. The migration to new equipment would ensure that phone services could be continued 

with minimal downtime should there be equipment or services failure.  If an award is made, staff 

anticipates installation beginning end of June.  Below are examples of what the handsets will look 

like. 

 

 



Approval of Checks

 

Commission Meeting 18-May-17

          STAFF SUMMARY REPORT

ACTION REQUESTED BY: Joe Sedillo, Finance Director

  (624-6646)

ACTION REQUESTED:

Approval of Checks

ITEM SUMMARY:

  

A/P: 7-Apr-17  $416,191.02  
10-Apr-17  $500.00

 13-Apr-17  $532,142.86  

 17-Apr-17  $780.00

 21-Apr-17  $181,058.70

 28-Apr-17  $270,402.90

   

PAYROLL: 9-Apr-17 REGULAR $258,323.52

 FINALS $4,017.30

 FIREFIGHTERS $457.10

 23-Apr-17 REGULAR $282,034.66

FINALS $3,915.19

  

  

   

    

    

   

     Grand Total Checks to be Approved: $1,949,823.25

 

SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:

Copies of Bills Lists

SUMMARY BY: Cindy Mealand

TITLE: A/P Officer































































April 20April 20April 20April 2017 P17 P17 P17 P----Card ReportCard ReportCard ReportCard Report    
 

Account Department Item Total 

401-2-200 Total Benefit Source (Payroll) $12,240.07  

401-6-611 Total Commissioners $775.00  

401-6-612 Total County Manager $284.83  

401-6-613 Total Human Resources $5,781.37  

401-6-614 Total Safety $1,683.00  

401-6-616 Total Fire & Emergency Services $487.37  

401-6-621 Total Public Works $3,563.26  

401-6-622 Total Information Technology $2,185.40  

401-6-624 Total Planning & Zoning $2,502.08  

401-6-625 Total Purchasing $106.97  

401-6-631 Total Finance Department $539.47  

401-6-632 Total Community Development $26.23  

401-6-641 Total Detention Administration $2,361.29  

401-6-642 Total Adult Detention $566.00  

401-6-645 Total Juvenile CCJD $3,493.27  

401-6-691 Total Facility Maintenance $4,312.30  

401-6-692 Total Courthouse Maintenance $3,362.63  

401-6-693 Total Facility Maintenance. Health 

Dept. 

$1,796.31  

401-6-694 Total Facility Maintenance. CC Road 

Dept. 

$1,144.96  

401-6-696 Total Operating Exp - CCDC $529.85  

401-7-721 Total Clerk Admin $295.69  

401-7-722 Total Clerk Bureau Elec. $637.44  

401-7-731 Total Assessor Admin $3,598.56  

401-7-732 Total Assessor Appraisal $1,044.92  

401-7-741 Total Treasurer Dept. $2,900.43  



401-7-751 Total Sheriff Admin $12,643.20  

401-7-752 Total Sheriff Patrol & Investigation $1,266.32  

402-6-651 Total Road Admin $3,446.85  

402-6-652 Total Road Shop $12,418.95  

402-6-653 Total Road Construction & 

Maintenance 

$13,778.51  

402-6-654 Total Road Vector Control $14.99  

407-8-811 Total Dunken FD $833.71  

408-8-812 Total East Grand Plains FD $1,365.78  

409-8-813 Total Penasco FD $3,571.45  

410-8-816 Total Midway FD $7,546.12  

411-8-814 Total Berrendo FD $1,540.96  

411-8-828 Total Berrendo FD $844.00  

412-8-815 Total Sierra FD $7,236.79  

413-8-818 Total Rio Felix FD $366.12  

414-8-819 Total Fire District #8 $590.42  

427-6-638 Total Indigent $40.65  

430-7-753 Total Law Enforcement $545.71  

432-7-761 Total DWI  $781.88  

432-7-762 Total DWI  $20.39  

432-7-765 Total DWI  $307.61  

452-8-832 Total Flood Dept. $17,639.39  

620-7-725 Total Clerk  $28,203.46  

628-7-733 Total Assessor $374.50  

631-8-886 Total Other Grant's & Contracts $43.50  

650-6-684 Total CCDC Construction Fund $34,985.62  

670-6-671 Total Internal Services $3,670.85  

Grand Total 
 

$210,296.43  
 



CHAVES COUNTY

ROAD DEPARTMENT

1505 East Brasher Road

Roswell, New Mexico 88203

Phone: 575-624-6610

Fax: 575-627-4360

Road Operations Director
Joe E. West

01 r

Joseph R. Skeen Building

April 2017

COMMISSIONERS

James W. Duffey • District 1

T. Calder Ezzell Jr. ■ District 2

Jeff Bilberry • District 3

Robert Corn • District 4

William E. Gavin • District 5

County Manager
Stanton L. Riggs

MAN-HOURS

MANPOWER COST

MAN-HOURS ON ROAD PROJECTS

MANPOWER COST ON ROAD PROJECTS

MILES BEADED

MILES MOWED

VEHICLE MILEAGE and OFF-ROAD HOURS

VEHICLE AND EQUIPMENT COSTS

GALLONS WATER HAULED

COST OF CIP^ WATER

COST OF PRIVATE BILLED WATER

MATERIAL HAULED (cubic yards)
CHIPS USED ON ROAD PROJECTS

BASE COURSE USED ON ROAD PROJECTS

COLD MIX USED ON ROAD PROJECTS

FINES USED ON ROAD PROJECTS

MILUNGS

PIT RUN USED ON ROAD PROJECTS

RIP RAP USED ON ROAD PROJECTS

ROAD OIL

PRIMER

CHFRS-2P

DEMURRAGE

GAS (gallons)
DIESEL (gallons)
GAS - Dunken (gallons)
DIESEL - Dunken (gallons)

COST OF ROADWORK

COST OF SOQD WASTE

7,123.25

5,989.75

150.97

0.00

5,641.20

604,350.00

20.00

3,044.00
72.00

0.00

0.00

20.00

0.00

1756.70

10231.60

95.10

525.50

$208,626.17

$179,766.90

$235,093.22

$436.30
$0.00

$337.60
$10,166.96
$5,040.00

$0.00
$0.00

$120.00
$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$3,669.59
$22,934.14

$200.85
$684.49

$458,450.05

$9,573.02

30/e. west
ROAD OPERATIONS DIRECTOR



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Sheriff’s Monthly Statistics Report 
March 2017 

 

Commission Meeting: May 18, 2017 

 

Total Number of Arrests: 83 
 Adult: 82 
 Juvenile: 1 

  
Total Number of DWI’s: 7 
  
Total Number of Arrest Citations: 14 
 Adult: 10 
 Juvenile: 4 

  
Total Number of Traffic Citations: 143 
  
Total Number of Accident Reports: 9 

 
 

 



Unit # Year Make Model Assigned to Mileage Beg. Mileage End Total

900 2013 Ford Taurus Hardy, Travis 97179 97179 0
901 2016 Ford F-250 Crew Cab Vasquez, Baldo 36226 38947 2721
902 2009 Ford F-150 Ouillette, Scott 162116 163696 1580
903 2014 Ford F-150 Serna, Jimmy (AC) 37746 38977 1231
904 2005 Ford F-550 Command Vehicle 4795 4795 0
905 2017 Ford F-150 Ouillette, Scott (NEW) 265 437 172
906 2013 Ford Taurus Spare 98340 98340 0
907 2011 Ford F-250 Drake, Charles 198184 200975 2791
908 2013 Ford Taurus Whitzel, David 108088 110035 1947
909 2010 Ford F-150 Hite, Laura (AC) 114624 116018 1394
910 2014 Ford F-150 4x4 Baker, Shane 34958 36507 1549

911 2016 Ford Expedition 4x4 Mason, James 18295 20600 2305
912 2016 Ford Expedition 4x4 Ramirez, Hector 24850 26440 1590
913 2016 Ford Expedition 4x4 Ray, Mike 20312 22461 2149
915 2008 Dodge Charger Ornelas, Daniel 81223 81500 277
917 2009 Ford Crown Victoria Spare 132576 132576 0
918 2006 Ford Van Transport 104441 104754 313
919 2009 Ford Crown Victoria Spare 139525 139525 0
920 2008 Ford Crown Victoria Valderaz, Raul 75925 76490 565
921 2013 Ford Taurus Padilla, Olivia 96784 99116 2332
923 2005 Ford F-150 Perham, Doug 96639 96885 246
924 2008 Ford Crown Victoria Spare 121631 121631 0

926 2008 Ford Crown Victoria Spare 141098 141098 0
927 2008 Ford Crown Victoria Spare 155811 155811 0
928 2010 Dodge Van Transport 135473 136120 647
929 2013 Ford Explorer Perez, Agustin 44469 45295 826
930 2014 Ford Taurus Wilson, Maria 26190 26610 420
931 2008 Ford Crown Victoria Herrington, Mike 106236 107014 778

933 2017 Ford Explorer NEW 260 260 0
934 2017 Ford Explorer NEW 260 260 0
935 2017 Ford Explorer NEW 260 260 0
937 2015 Chevy Caprice Hohle, Doug 36390 38110 1720
938 2015 Chevy Caprice Spare 50730 50730 0
939 2015 Chevy Caprice Seely, Will 35894 37625 1731
941 2014 Ford Taurus Covarrubias, Allan 43999 46217 2218
942 2011 Ford Crown Victoria Stephenson, Landon 104271 105239 968
943 2014 Ford Taurus Sanchez, Jacob 43914 45947 2033
944 2014 Ford Taurus Ramirez, Giovanny 61508 63079 1571
945 2014 Ford Taurus Silvas, Pedro 55476 57340 1864
946 2014 Ford Taurus Parmer, Jeromy 66929 68401 1472
947 2013 Chevy Tahoe Snyder, Britt 33790 34861 1071

948 2011 Ford Crown Victoria Flores, Jerry 121541 124094 2553
951 2010 Ford Crown Victoria McDaniel, Dallas 62141 62800 659
952 2010 Ford Expedition Ramirez, Joel 125533 126163 630
953 2010 Ford Expedition Childress, Colter 108008 109910 1902
955 2013 Ford Focus Serrano, Agustin (Civil) 57758 59124 1366
956 2014 Ford Taurus Villarreal, PJ 63614 64915 1301
957 2014 Ford Taurus Shannon, Mike 78819 80739 1920
960 2007 Ford Crown Victoria Sedillo, Tony 76241 77058 817
962 2015 Dodge Caravan Transport 63221 64451 1230
963 2007 Ford Crown Victoria Beagles-Clark, Amanda 132927 134110 1183
965 2007 Ford Crown Victoria Clark, Todd 172840 174390 1550

TOTAL: 55592

CCSO Mileage Report
April 2017
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