
CHAVES COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS 

REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING AGENDA 

June 18, 2020 –9:00 a.m. 

Chaves County Administrative Center – Joseph R. Skeen Building 

Commission Chambers - #1 St. Mary’s Place 
 

 

CALL TO ORDER 

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

DETERMINATION OF QUORUM 

APPROVAL OF MINUTES 

 

AGENDA ITEMS 

 
  

A. PUBLIC HEARINGS  

 

1. 2020 Chaves County Annual Road Hearing 

 

 

B. AGREEMENTS AND RESOLUTIONS  

 

   

2. Agreement A-20-008 between Chaves County and the State of New Mexico 

Children, Youth, and Families Department 

 

3. Agreement A-20-013 between Chaves County and the State of New Mexico, 

DFA/Local Government Division for DWI Local Grant FY 20/21  

 

4. A.  Agreement A-20-014 between Chaves County and Character Counts 

 

B. Agreement A-20-015 between Chaves County and The Every Fifteen Minute 

Program 

 

C. Agreement A-20-016 between Chaves County and C.A.S.A 

 

D. Agreement A-20-017 between Chaves County and ASPEN of New Mexico 

 

5. Agreement A-20-018 Lease (with option to buy) for (1) 2020 Volvo L90H Wheel 

Loader 

 

 

 



6. Resolution R-20-018 Accepting 2020-2021 NMDOT LGRF County Arterial 

Program 

 

7. Resolution R-20-019 Adopting 2020-2021 NMDOT LGRF Cooperative Program 

 

8. Resolution R-20-020 Accepting 2019/2020 NMDOT LGRF School Bus Program 

 

9. Resolution R-20-021 Deletion of Property & Proposed Disposition 

 

E. ITB/RFP’S 

 

10. ITB-20-2 Oils and Lubricants 

 

11. RFP-20-2 Dental Benefits 

 

 

F. OTHER BUSINESS 

 

12. MOU Between US Fish & Wildlife Service and the Arizona County Signatories 

and the New Mexico Signatories  

 

 

APPROVAL OF CHECKS 

 

APPROVAL OF REPORTS 

 

UNSCHEDULED COMMUNICATIONS LIMITED TO THREE MINUTES PER 

VISITOR NOT TO EXCEED 15 MINUTES NO FORMAL ACTION TAKEN BY 

COMMISSION 

  

• COUNTY MANAGER’S COMMUNICATIONS 

• COMMISSIONER’S COMMUNICATIONS 

• SIGNATURE OF DOCUMENTS 

• ADJOURNMENT 
 
If you are an individual with a disability who needs a reader, qualified sign language interpreter, or any form of auxiliary aid or 
service to attend or participate in the hearing of a meeting, please contact the County Commissioner’s office at 575-624-6600.  
This should be done at least one week prior to the meeting.  Public documents, including the agenda and minutes, can be 
provided in various accessible formats.  Please contact the County Commissioner’s office if a summary or other type of 
accessible format is needed. 



 

AGENDA ITEM: _________   2020 Chaves County Annual Road Hearing 

  

                               

MEETING DATE: June 18, 2020 

 

 

STAFF SUMMARY REPORT 

 

 

ACTION REQUESTED BY: Public Services Department 

 

ACTION REQUESTED:  Consideration of all 2020 Road Hearing requests 

              

 

ITEM SUMMARY:   

 

Having received the applications for the 2020 Annual Chaves County Road Hearing it is 

requested that the Chaves County Commission hear any public input with regard to the requested 

roads. 

 

 

This is a public hearing which was properly advertised per statute requirements. 

 

 

SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:  Copy of applications, Freeholder summary report 

 

 

 

SUMMARY BY: Bill Williams 

 

TITLE:  Public Services Director 
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Chaves County received a total of 14 road hearing documents for 2020. All of the documents 

were completed as per the Chaves County Road Policy. 

Of the 14 applications seven road maintenance status changes, two new road requests, and 

five road vacations were requested. On Tuesday March 9, 2020 the Chaves County Board of 

Freeholders went for site visits at each of this year’s requested road locations. In every instance 

the Freeholders voted unanimously for their final recommendations. Please accept the following 

summary. 

Maintenance Status Change Requests 

Recommendation FOR Maintenance Status Change from Freeholders 

 

Road Maintenance Status Change Application #1: Nickolas McClelland is asking for the 

County to assume maintenance of Paul Avenue (approx. 1750 ft). Freeholders recommend that 

this application be APPROVED.  

 

Road Maintenance Status Change Application #2: Allen Gedde is asking for the County to 

assume maintenance of El Rosal Street (approx. 2220 ft). Freeholders recommend that this 

application be APPROVED.  

 

Road Maintenance Status Change Application #3: Allen Gedde is asking for the County to 

assume maintenance of El Arco Way Road (approx. 1090 ft). Freeholders recommend that this 

application be APPROVED. 

 

COMMISSIONERS 

Dara Dana · District 1 

T. Calder Ezzell Jr. · District 2 

Jeff Bilberry · District 3 

Robert Corn · District 4 

William E Cavin · District 5         

County Manager 

Stanton L. Riggs 

PUBLIC SERVICES  

PO Box 1817 

Roswell, NM 88202-1817 

PHONE:   575-624-6611 

FAX:   575-624-6631 

bwilliams@co.chaves.nm.us 

Public Services Director 

Bill Williams 



Road Maintenance Status Change Application #4: Allen Gedde is asking for the County to 

assume maintenance of Los Padrinos Road (approx. 350 ft). Freeholders recommend that this 

application be APPROVED. 

 

Road Maintenance Status Change Application #5: Mary Ann Rogers is asking for the County 

to assume maintenance of Larry Drive (approx. 1050 ft). Freeholders recommend that this 

application be APPROVED. 

 

Road Maintenance Status Change Application #7: William Schwalm is asking for the County 

to assume maintenance of Allen Avenue (approx. 1162 ft). Freeholders recommend that this 

application be APPROVED. 

 

Road Maintenance Status Change Application #11: Chaves County is asking for the County 

to assume maintenance of Suzanne Drive (from Allen Avenue to Sycamore) (approx. 490 ft). 

Freeholders recommend that this application be APPROVED. 

 

New Road Requests 

Recommendation FOR New Road Requests from Freeholders 

 

New Road Request Application #6: Michael Gomez is asking for the County to accept Ambush 

Road (approx. 3950 ft) as a new road. Freeholders recommend that this application be 

APPROVED. 

 

New Road Request Application #13: Theresa Vargas (on behalf of her parents who own 

property on this road) is asking for the County to accept Hopi Road (approx. 2750ft) as a new 

road. Freeholders recommend that this application be APPROVED. 

 

 

 

 



Road Vacation Requests 

Recommendations FOR Road Vacation from Freeholders 

 

Road Vacation Application #8-Loftis Lane:  Don and Nancy Miles are requesting the vacation 

of approx. 7,180 feet of Loftis Lane C3-008 from approx. 2530 feet south of Lynette Road. This 

portion of Loftis Lane is non-county maintained and has been behind a gate on their property for 

decades. Freeholders agree that this road meets the requirements to be considered for vacation. 

 

Road Vacation Application #9-Consuelo Road:  Chaves County Road Department is 

requesting the vacation of the north 980 feet  of Consuelo Road C3-165 from Cindy Road north 

to the end. The Bogles built a new section of road which connects Consuelo Road to Cindy Road 

without going through the front yard of the ranch house. Freeholders agree that this road meets 

the requirements to be considered for vacation.  

 

Road Vacation Application #10-Cindy Road:  Chaves County Road Department is requesting 

the vacation of the north 820 feet of Cindy Road C3-161 from the new portion of Cindy Road 

north to the end. The Bogles built a new section of road which connects Consuelo Road to Cindy 

Road without going through the front yard of the ranch house. Freeholders agree that this road 

meets the requirements to be considered for vacation.  

 

Road Vacation Application #12-Suzanne Drive:  Thomas Kiley is requesting the vacation of 

the west 250 feet of Suzanne Drive. This portion of Suzanne Drive was never opened to public 

use within the subdivision. Freeholders agree that this road meets the requirements to be 

considered for vacation.  

 

Road Vacation Application #14-Oasis Road:  Adelante Farms is requesting the vacation of 

Oasis Road C1-249 from Woodbine way to East Grand Plains Road (approx. 6750 ft). 

Freeholders agree that this road meets the requirements to be considered for vacation.  
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Item #                  Lease (with option to buy) for (1) 2020 
Volvo L90H Wheel Loader 

 

Meeting Date: 06/18/2020 
  
 

STAFF SUMMARY 

______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
REQUESTED BY:   Sandra Rodriguez, Purchasing Director 
 
ACTION REQUIRED:  Approval 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
SUMMARY: 
 
Chaves County Road Department is requesting to lease a new Wheel Loader.  Money has been 
approved in the 20-21 Fiscal Budget. 
 
Contract is with Sierra Machinery 
Monthly lease payment of  $1,647.40 
 
 
 
 
Staff recommends approval. 
 
 
 
 
______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:   None 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
Submitted by:  Sandra Rodriguez 
Title:  Purchasing Director 
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AGENDA ITEM:  _________                                  Resolution R-20-018-Accepting 2020/2021 

 NMDOT LGRF County Arterial Program 

  NMDOT Contract L200504  

 

 

                                

MEETING DATE: June 18, 2020 

 

 

STAFF SUMMARY REPORT 

 

 

 

ACTION REQUESTED BY: Bill Williams, Public Services Director  

 

ACTION REQUESTED:  Approve Resolution 

 

 

 

ITEM SUMMARY: 

 

This Local Government Road Fund (LGRF) offer from the New Mexico Department of 

Transportation (NMDOT) is for a single penetration chip seal on approximately 57.66 miles of 

County Roads.  The roads proposed for this project have not been resurfaced for 6 to 8 years.  

The work will be cost shared as follows: 

 

     NMDOT  $245,479.00 

     Chaves County   $81,826.00 

     Total Project  $327,305.00 

 

NMDOT has created the cooperative agreement which requires the Chairman’s signature.  

 

 

Staff recommends approval of Resolution R-20-018 

 

 

 

 

SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:  Resolution R-20-018 

 

 

 

SUMMARY BY: Bill Williams  

 

TITLE:  Public Services Director  
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 RESOLUTION R-20-018 
 

CHAVES COUNTY                                                      
PARTICIPATION IN LOCAL GOVERNMENT ROAD FUND PROGRAM ADMINISTERED  BY 

NEW MEXICO DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 
 

 
WHEREAS, Chaves County and the New Mexico Department of Transportation enter into 

a cooperative agreement; and 
 

WHEREAS, the total cost of the project will be $327,305.00 to be funded in proportional 
share by the parties hereto as follows: 

 
a. New Mexico Department of Transportation’s share shall be 75% or $245,479.00; 

and 
 

b. Chaves County’s proportional matching share shall be 25% or $81,826.00 
 

TOTAL PROJECT COST IS $327,305.00 
 

 Chaves County shall pay all costs, which exceed the total amount of $245,479.00 
 

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, in official session that Chaves County 
determines, resolves, and orders as follows: 

 
That the project for this Cooperative agreement is adopted and has a priority standing. 
 
This agreement terminates on December 31, 2021 and Chaves County incorporates all 

the agreements, covenants, and understandings between the parties hereto concerning the 
subject matter hereof, and all such covenants, agreements and understandings have been 
merged into the written agreement. 

 
 NOW THEREFORE BE FURTHER RESOLVED by Chaves County to enter into 
Cooperative Agreement Control Number L200504 with the New Mexico Department of 
Transportation for LGRF Project for the year 2020 - 2021 to plan, design, construction, 
reconstruction, pavement rehabilitation/improvements, blading and shaping, drainage 
improvements, on these county roads within the control of Chaves County, New Mexico. 
 
The routes and termini are as follows: 
 

Hagerman Cut Off: NM 249 S. to Eddy County Line, Dusty Miller Rd: N. Sycamore Rd to 
Eisenhower Rd, E. 19th St: Fowler Rd to Red Bridge Rd, E. Grand Plains Rd: NM 253 to Oasis 
Rd., E. Pine Lodge Rd: Old Clovis Hwy to Bitter Lakes Refuge, Eisenhower Rd. N: N. from Pine 
Lodge Rd, Fowler Rd: E. College St to E. 19th St, Ponderosa Rd: US 380 N. to US 70. Red 
Bridge Rd. N: US 380 N. to Pine Lodge Rd, W. Berrendo Rd: N. Montana St to Peaceful Valley 
Rd, Wichita Rd: Bottomless Lakes S. to Ojibwa Rd, Peaceful Valley Rd: W. Berrendo Rd to 
Country Club Rd, Eisenhower Rd S.: Bland St to Brasher Rd, McGaffey St: Roswell Limits to 
Relief Route.   
 
Total Miles: 57.66 



 
 
 

PASSED, ADOPTED, SIGNED AND APPROVED THIS _____ DAY OF JUNE, 2020. 
 

BOARD OF CHAVES COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 
 
 
      ___________________________________ 

      William E. Cavin, Chairman 
   
      ________________________________ 
      Jeff Bilberry, Vice-Chairman 
 
ATTEST:     ________________________________ 

 Dara Dana, Member 
 
      ________________________________ 
_____________________   T. Calder Ezzell Jr., Member  
Dave Kunko   
County Clerk     ________________________________ 
      Robert Corn, Member 

 



 

AGENDA ITEM:  _________                                  Resolution R-20-019-Adopting 2020/2021

 NMDOT LGRF Cooperative Program  

  NMDOT Contract L200489 

 

 

                                

MEETING DATE: June 18, 2020 

 

 

STAFF SUMMARY REPORT 

 

 

 

ACTION REQUESTED BY: Bill Williams, Public Services Director  

 

ACTION REQUESTED:  Approve Resolution 

 

 

 

ITEM SUMMARY: 

 

This Local Government Road Fund (LGRF) offer from the New Mexico Department of 

Transportation (NMDOT) is for a single penetration chip seal on approximately 30.40  miles of 

County Roads.  The roads proposed for this project have not been resurfaced for 6 to 8 years.  

The work will be cost shared as follows: 

 

     NMDOT  $  92,790.00 

     Chaves County $  30,930.00 

     Total Project  $123,720.00 

 

NMDOT has created the cooperative agreement which requires the Chairman’s signature.  

 

 

Staff recommends approval of Resolution R-20-019 

 

 

 

 

SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:  Resolution R-20-019 

 

 

 

SUMMARY BY: Bill Williams  

 

TITLE:  Public Services Director  
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 RESOLUTION R-20-019 
 

CHAVES COUNTY                                                      
PARTICIPATION IN LOCAL GOVERNMENT ROAD FUND PROGRAM ADMINISTERED  BY 

NEW MEXICO DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 
 

 
WHEREAS, Chaves County and the New Mexico Department of Transportation enter into 

a cooperative agreement; and 
 

WHEREAS, the total cost of the project will be $123,720.00 to be funded in proportional 
share by the parties hereto as follows: 

 
a. New Mexico Department of Transportation’s share shall be 75% or $92,790.00; 

and 
 

b. Chaves County’s proportional matching share shall be 25% or $30,930.00 
 

TOTAL PROJECT COST IS $123,720.00 
 

 Chaves County shall pay all costs, which exceed the total amount of $92,790.00 
 

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, in official session that Chaves County 
determines, resolves, and orders as follows: 

 
That the project for this Cooperative agreement is adopted and has a priority standing. 
 
This agreement terminates on December 31, 2021 and Chaves County incorporates all 

the agreements, covenants, and understandings between the parties hereto concerning the 
subject matter hereof, and all such covenants, agreements and understandings have been 
merged into the written agreement. 

 
 NOW THEREFORE BE FURTHER RESOLVED by Chaves County to enter into 
Cooperative Agreement Control Number L200489 with the New Mexico Department of 
Transportation for LGRF Project for the year 2020 - 2021 to plan, design, construction, 
reconstruction, pavement rehabilitation/improvements, blading and shaping, drainage 
improvements, on these county roads within the control of Chaves County, New Mexico. 
 
The routes and termini are as follows: 
 

Alabama Rd: NM 256 S. to End, Baker Rd: Woodbine Way to E. Grand Plains Rd, 
Bam Rd: Floyd Rd to Lou Rd, Brasher Rd, E.: NM 254 to NM 261, Burns Rd: US 
285 to Lou Rd, Calumet Rd: E. Berrrendo Rd to Isler Rd, Carson City Rd: Honolulu 
Rd to Nashville Rd, Fisk Rd: Orchard Park Rd to End, Floyd Rd: US 285 to Bam 
Rd, Honolulu Rd: Y-O Rd to Orchard Park Rd, Huskey Rd: Roswell Limits W. to 
End, Ken Rd: US 285 to Bam Rd, La Joya Rd: E. Berrendo Rd to E. Pine Lodge 
Rd, Lou Rd: Burns Rd to Bam Rd, Menominee Rd: E. Grand Plains Rd to Hobson 
Rd, Mescalero Rd, E: N. Atkinson E.  To End, Mescalero Rd, E: LaJara Rd to 
Yeso Rd, Nashville Rd: Y-O Rd S. to End, Oasis Dr: Woodbine Way to E. Grand 
Plains Rd, Old Chisum Trail: E. Darby to End, Onyx Rd: S. Eisenhower Rd E. to 



End, Pawhatten Rd: Cedarvale Rd to Woodbine Way, Phoenix Rd: No Name Rd to 
Houma Rd, Portales Rd: N. Atkinson Rd to Clayton Rd, Portales Rd: Calumet Rd 
W. to End, Railroad Ln: E. Berrendo Rd to E. Pine Lodge Rd, Richmond Rd: 
Honolulu Rd to Nashville Rd, Seminole Rd: US 380 S. to NM 261, Sena Rd: E. 
19th N. to End, Spring River Rd: NM 254 to NM 261, Vineyard Rd: E. Darby 
to Vista Largo Rd, Vista Largo Rd: Vineyard Rd E. to End, Whitney Lane: E. Grand 
Plains Rd N. to End, Woodbine Way: Pawhatten Rd to Oasis Dr, Yeso Rd: E. 
Mescalero Rd to McPherson Rd.   
 
TOTAL MILES: 30.40  
 
 

PASSED, ADOPTED, SIGNED AND APPROVED THIS _____ DAY OF JUNE, 2020. 
 

BOARD OF CHAVES COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 
 
 
      ___________________________________ 

      William E. Cavin, Chairman 
   
      ________________________________ 
      Jeff Bilberry, Vice-Chairman 
 
ATTEST:     ________________________________ 

 Dara Dana, Member 
 
      ________________________________ 
_____________________   T. Calder Ezzell Jr., Member  
Dave Kunko   
County Clerk     ________________________________ 
      Robert Corn, Member 

 



 

AGENDA ITEM:  _________                                  Resolution R-20-020-Accepting 2020/2021

 NMDOT LGRF School Bus Program  

  NMDOT Contract L200510      

 

 

                                

MEETING DATE: June 18, 2020 

 

 

STAFF SUMMARY REPORT 

 

 

 

ACTION REQUESTED BY: Bill Williams, Public Services Director  

 

ACTION REQUESTED:  Approve Resolution 

 

 

 

ITEM SUMMARY: 

 

This Local Government Road Fund (LGRF) offer from the New Mexico Department of 

Transportation (NMDOT) is for a single penetration chip seal on approximately 20.58  miles of 

County Roads.  The roads proposed for this project have not been resurfaced for 6 to 8 years.  

The work will be cost shared as follows: 

 

     NMDOT  $116,333.00 

     Chaves County $  38,778.00 

     Total Project  $155,111.00 

 

NMDOT has created the cooperative agreement which requires the Chairman’s signature.  

 

 

Staff recommends approval of Resolution R-20-020 

 

 

 

 

SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:  Resolution R-20-020  

 

 

 

SUMMARY BY: Bill Williams  

 

TITLE:  Public Services Director  
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 RESOLUTION R-20-020 
 

CHAVES COUNTY                                                      
PARTICIPATION IN LOCAL GOVERNMENT ROAD FUND PROGRAM ADMINISTERED  BY 

NEW MEXICO DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 
 

 
WHEREAS, Chaves County and the New Mexico Department of Transportation enter into 

a cooperative agreement; and 
 

WHEREAS, the total cost of the project will be $155,111.00 to be funded in proportional 
share by the parties hereto as follows: 

 
a. New Mexico Department of Transportation’s share shall be 75% or $116,333.00; 

and 
 

b. Chaves County’s proportional matching share shall be 25% or $38,778.00 
 

TOTAL PROJECT COST IS $155,111.00 
 

 Chaves County shall pay all costs, which exceed the total amount of $116,333.00 
 

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, in official session that Chaves County 
determines, resolves, and orders as follows: 

 
That the project for this Cooperative agreement is adopted and has a priority standing. 
 
This agreement terminates on December 31, 2021 and Chaves County incorporates all 

the agreements, covenants, and understandings between the parties hereto concerning the 
subject matter hereof, and all such covenants, agreements and understandings have been 
merged into the written agreement. 

 
 NOW THEREFORE BE FURTHER RESOLVED by Chaves County to enter into 
Cooperative Agreement Control Number L200510 with the New Mexico Department of 
Transportation for LGRF Project for the year 2020 - 2021 to plan, design, construction, 
reconstruction, pavement rehabilitation/improvements, blading and shaping, drainage 
improvements, on these county roads within the control of Chaves County, New Mexico. 
 
The routes and termini are as follows: 
 

27th Ave: Nevada St to Aspen St, Acacia Rd: W. Pine Lodge Rd N. to End, Ada Rd: Brown Rd 
E. to End, Aspen Ave, N: W. Country Club Rd to W. Mescalero Rd, Atoka Rd: Brown Rd E. to 
End, Blue Mountain Rd: N. Montana Ave E. to Roswell Limits, Bonham Lane: N. Brown Rd to 
Haley Circle, Brandon Ave: N. Sycamore Ave to N. Aspen Ave, Briggs Rd: E. from N. Atkinson 
Ave, Carolina Way: N. Sycamore Ave to Nevada Ave, Cedarvale Rd: NM 251 to Pawhatten Rd, 
Charleston Rd, W: Brown Rd to Old Hondo Channel, Clayton Rd: Isler Rd to Portales Rd, Crow 
Rd: NM 2 W. to End, Eagles Nest Rd: E. Darby Rd S. to End, Gallina Rd: US 285 to Old Clovis 
Hwy, Georgia Rd: McGaffey St to W. Bland St, Gramma Rd: Sacaton Rd to Tamarack Rd, Haley 
Circle: Bonham Lane to Bonham Lane, Isler Rd: Old Clovis Hwy E. to End, Ladrones Rd: US 285 
E. to Old Clovis Hwy, Margaret Woolridge Rd: W. McGaffey St to W. 2nd St, Membres Rd: N. 



Atkinson St E. to End, Mescalero Rd, W: N. Sycamore E. to Roswell Limits, Michigan St: Pine 
Lodge Rd N. to End, Montana Ave, N: W. Berrendo Rd N. to End, Nevada Ave: Country Club Rd 
to Mescalero Rd, Sacaton Rd: US 285 E. to End, Spruce St: W. Country Club Rd to 27th St, 
Townsend Trail: Brown Rd to Brown Rd, Walker Rd: N. Atkinson E. to End, Wiggins Rd: Old 
Clovis Hwy to N. Atkinson Ave.     
 
TOTAL MILES: 20.58 
 

 
PASSED, ADOPTED, SIGNED AND APPROVED THIS _____ DAY OF JUNE, 2020. 

 
BOARD OF CHAVES COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 

 
 
      ___________________________________ 

      William E. Cavin, Chairman 
   
      ________________________________ 
      Jeff Bilberry, Vice-Chairman 
 
ATTEST:     ________________________________ 

 Dara Dana, Member 
 
      ________________________________ 
_____________________   T. Calder Ezzell Jr., Member  
Dave Kunko   
County Clerk     ________________________________ 
      Robert Corn, Member 
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Item #          ITB-20-2 – Oils and Lubricants    

 

Meeting Date: 06/18/2020 

  

STAFF SUMMARY 

              

 

REQUESTED BY:   Sandra Rodriguez, Purchasing Director 

 

ACTION REQUIRED:   Award Bid ITB-20-2 

   

              

 

SUMMARY:   

 

The following bids were submitted under ITB-20-2 for Oils and Lubricants: 
 
Item No.          Description UNIT QTY WAKEFIELD OIL BELL GAS GALP BREWER OIL

1 SAE 15W40 MOTOR OIL 55 GAL DRUM 1 $519.93 $557.80 $509.41 $388.85

2 SAE 15W40 MOTOR OIL QT BOTTLES 60 $3.86 $4.26 No bid $2.82

3 SAE 15W40 MOTOR OIL 330 OR 275  TOTE 1 $9.45 $8.80 $8.38 $6.98

4 255D-UNIVERSAL HYD/TRANS OIL 55 GAL DRUM 1 $422.35 $418.48 $469.00 $316.25

5 255D-UNIVERSAL HYD/TRANS OIL 330 OR 275  TOTE 1 $7.67 $7.36 $7.54 $5.67

6 SAE 5W20 MOTOR OIL 330 OR 275  TOTE 1 $8.33 $8.09 No bid $5.60

7 SAE 5W20 MOTOR OIL QT BOTTLES 60 $3.19 $3.00 No bid $2.82

8 SAE 30W TRANS-CATERPILLAR TO4 55 GAL DRUM 1 $577.91 $528.47 $696.00 $466.40

9 DEXTRON ATF QT BOTTLES 60 $3.72 $2.92 $4.71 $1.89

10 DEXTRON ATF 5 GAL PAIL 1 $55.14 $46.00 $153.00 $39.25

11 SAE 80W90 GEAR OIL 55 GAL DRUM 1 $650.09 $538.02 $619.00 $452.00

12 SAE 80W90 GEAR OIL QT BOTTLES 1 $3.74 $4.86 $6.81 $2.59

13 SAE 80W90 GEAR OIL 5 GAL PAIL 1 $59.69 $56.38 $105.76 $41.30

14 HIGH TEMP RED GREASE (MYSTIC BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) 120 LB. CAN 2 $402.38 $305.85 $403.00 $525.60

15 HIGH TEMP RED GREASE (MYSTIC BRAND OR EQUIVALENT) TUBES 50 $3.28 $2.78 $3.76 $2.31

16 SAE 75W90 SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 5 GAL PAIL 2 $101.96 $131.27 $116.05 $283.50

17 ALL MAKE MODELS ANTIFREEZE  CONCENTRATE 55 GAL DRUM 1 $592.23 $510.55 No bid $732.05

18 ALL MAKE  MODELS ANTIFREEZE  CONCENTRATE 1 GAL JUGS 18 $10.86 $10.95 No bid $14.05

19 MOBILE DELVAC SYNTHETIC ATF OR EQUIVALENT 1 GAL JUGS 20 $55.36 $52.25 No bid $29.29

20 FORD LV ATF QT Bottles 24 $5.55 $5.10 $5.48 $2.97

21 HEAVY DUTY ENGINE ANTIFREEZE W/CATERPILLAR SPEC EC-1 1 GAL JUGS 18 $20.09 $17.50 No bid $9.09

22 DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF) 2.5 GAL JUGS 10 $8.35 $10.00 $17.98 $8.90  
 

 

Bid amounts were based on a summary of various products to be purchased under this price agreement 

and estimated quantities for each product, under which bidders submitted their pricing to ensure equal 

comparison.  The actual bid award will constitute a term price agreement which will be utilized to 

purchase products at the prices bid for the duration of the contract. 

 

Staff has reviewed all bids and recommends award to Brewer Oil Company.  

              

SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:   Bid Summary 

              

Submitted by: Sandra Rodriguez  

Title: Purchasing Director, CPO 
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BID SUMMARY 

BID #: ITB-20-2 

 

COMMODITY:  Oils and Lubricants 

 

USER DEPARTMENT(S): Road 

 

SPECIFICATIONS BY: Gerald Cox, Road Department Purchasing Officer 

 

ADVERTISED: April 27, 2020 in the Roswell Daily Record and online through the NM 

Purchasing Group 

 

ADDENDA ISSUED: None. 

 

OPEN DATE: May 14, 2020 

 

SPECIFIC DESCRIPTION: This is a routine bid for oils and lubricants that calls for a term 

contract (renewable annually for up to four years) for purchases made by the Chaves County 

Road Department.   



Item #                       RFP-20-2 – Dental Benefits    

 

Meeting Date: 06/18/2020 

  

 

STAFF SUMMARY 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

REQUESTED BY:   Sandra Rodriguez, Purchasing Director 

 

ACTION REQUIRED:  Award RFP-20-2 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

SUMMARY: 

 

Following are a list of the companies that submitted proposals under RFP-20-2 for Dental 

Benefits and final evaluation scores: 

 

OFFEROR       FINAL SCORE 
             (100 Possible Points) 

 

 

Benefit Source       95 

 

National Benefit Service Center (CIGNA)   74.25 

 

 

Staff recommends award be made to Benefit Source.  If awarded, a contract will be negotiated 

and brought back before the commission at the next meeting.  The initial contract term would run 

from January 1, 2021 to December 31, 2021 with the option to renew for up to three additional 

one-year terms.   

 

 

 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

SUPPORT DOCUMENTS:   RFP Summary 

______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

Submitted by: Sandra Rodriguez 

Title: Purchasing Director, CPO
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RFP SUMMARY 

 

 

RFP #: RFP-20-2 

 

COMMODITY: Dental Benefits for Chaves County 

 

USER DEPARTMENT(S): All 

 

SPECIFICATIONS BY: Sandra Rodriguez, Purchasing Director 

 

ADVERTISED: April 27, 2020 in the Roswell Daily Record and posted online through the NM Purchasing 

Group. 

 

ADDENDA ISSUED: None. 

 

OPEN DATE: June 2, 2020 

 

SPECIFIC DESCRIPTION: This is a routine request for proposals for Dental Benefits for Chaves County 

employees.  Companies are required to address and are evaluated based on the following items: 

 

 1. Response to how usual, customary and reasonable dental charges are determined 

 2. Listing of participating local dentists 

 3. Provision of diagnostic & preventative services 

 4. Provision of basic services, including restorative, oral surgery, endodontic and periodontics 

 5. Provision of major services, including prosthodontics 

 6. Response to deductible and maximum expenses 

 7. Provision of crowns and cast restorations 

 8. Structure of policy on pre-existing conditions, optional services, pre-determinations, eligibility and 

limitations. 

 9. Response to Compliance with Health Insurance Portability and Accountability Act (HIPAA). 

10.  All administrative and ancillary costs applicable under the services offered. 

 

 

Total
Factors for 

Evaluation

Factors for 

Evaluation

Factors for 

Evaluation

Factors for 

Evaluation

Factorsfor 

Evaluation

Factors for 

Evaluation

Factors for 

Evalution

Factors for 

Evaluation

Factors for 

Evaluation

Factors for 

Evaluaation

Supplier / 100 pts / 10 pts / 20 pts / 15 pts / 5 pts / 5 pts / 5 pts / 5 pts / 5 pts / 10 pts / 20 pts

BenefitSource 95 9 17.5 14.5 5 4.75 5 4.5 5 10 19.75

National Benefit 

Service Center
74.25 6.5 17.75 11.25 4.5 4.25 4.75 4.25 3.5 5.5 12

 



AGENDA ITEM: 

-

MEETING DATE: June 18,2020

STAFF SUMMARY REPORT

MOU Between US Fish & Wildlife
Service and the Arizona Countv
Siqnatorie s and the New Mexico Countv
Siqnatories

ACTION REQUESTED BY: Stanton L. Riggs, County Manager

Approve Participation/MOU

ITEM SUMMARY:

The purpose of this MOU is for the County to contribute to the preparation of a
Supplemental Environmental lmpact Statement. The proposed rule to revise the 2015
Mexican Wolf non-essential experimental population rule will be the proposed action of
the supplemental ElS.

The County proposed changes to the original MOU. The service accepted some of our
changes but not all. Although this is not a perfect MOU, staff does recommend approval
so we may have a seat at the table.

Staff recommends approval

SUMMARY BY:

TITLE:

ACTION REQUESTED:

SUPPORT DOCUMENTS: MOU

Stanton L. Riggs

County Manager
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Memorandum of Understanding
between the

U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service,
And the

Arizona County Signatoriesr,
And the

),lew Mexico County Signatories2

This Memorandum of Understanding (hereinatler ref'erred to as MOU) establishes a Cooperating
Agency relationship and a coordinating process and is made and entered into by and between
the:

A. U.S. Fish and Wildliie Service (Service). as authorized and directed under the NEPA
implementing regulations of 1977, as amended, and specifically acknowledging the following
areas ofthe regulations, which are of mutual interest to the parties 40 CFR 1506.2,40 CFR
1508.5,40 CFR 1501.7.40 CFR 1501.2,40 CFR 1508.27,40 CFR 1502.16, and 516 DM; and

B. Arizona County Signatories. as authorized under the State olArizona, enabling counties to
protect the health. safety. and welfare of its citizens, pursuant to Arizona Revised Statutes I l-
802 and I l-933, as well as County laws. including County land use plans, water and watershed
plans, and environmental and natural resource laws and policies; and

C. New Mexico County Signatories as authorized under the State of New Mexico, granting
powers necessary and proper to provide the saf'ety. preserve the health, promote the prosperity.
and improve the morals. orders. comfort, and convenience ofany County or its inhabitants,
pursuant to New Mexico Revised Statute 4-7-31 (1978), as well as County laws. including
County land use plans, water and watershed plans. and environmental and natural resource laws
and policies.

D. Hereinafter relened to as the Parties

SECTION II. STATEMENT OF PURPOSE

The purpose of this MOU is fbr the signatory entities to contribute to the preparation ola
supplemental Environmental Impact Statemenl (sElS). pursuant to the National Environmental

' Arizona County Signatories may include Apache, Pinal, Cochise, Santa Cruz, Coconino,
Yavapai, Gila Mohave, Maricopa, or Pima counties. as reflected in concurrence provided by
each county.

2 New Mexico County Signatories may include Bemalillo, Chaves, Cibola, Dona Ana, Grant,
Hidalgo, Lincoln, San Miguel, McKinley. Luna, Eddy. Torrance, Otero. Sierra, Socorro, or
Valencia counties, as reflected in concurrence provided by each county.

SECTION I. PARTIES
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Policy Act (NEPA). The proposed rule to revise the 2015 Mexican wolf nonessential
experimental population rule (80 FR 2512-2567) (2015 Final Rule) will be the proposed action
of our sEIS. We will analyze the environmental consequences from implementation of the
proposed action and alternatives to revise the authorized regulations for management ofthe
experimental population of Mexican wolves in the Mexican Wolf Experimental Population Area
(MWEPA) in Arizona and New Mexico. The new rule will replace and supersede the 2015 Final
Rule, pursuant to section l0O ofthe Endangered Species Act. The revised rule and sEIS are

being developed in response to a court-ordered remand by the District Court of Arizona ofour
2015 Final Rule that revised the nonessential experimental population designation and
management of Mexican wolves in the MWEPA.

For the purposes ofthe production ofan sEIS thal will analyze a range ofalternatives.
this MOU:

A. Confirms the formal designation of the Service as the Lead Federal Agency with
responsibility for completion ofthe sEIS and Record of Decision (ROD). The Lead Federal
Agency shall:

ul

l\

i.

ii.

ii i.

B. Formally designates the Parties as Cooperating Agencies. It is recognized that Cooperating
Agencies have legal authority and/or special expertise applicable to the planning process. Each
Cooperating Agency may, at their discretion:

Request the participation ofeach Cooperating Agency in the NEPA process at the earliest
possible time; and

Use the environmental analysis and proposals of Parties with jurisdiction by law and/or
special expertise, to the maximum extent possible consistent with its responsibility as Lead
Federal Agency; and

Meet, either in person or teleconferencing, with a Cooperating Agency at the latter's
request.

Request that the counties designate a representative to participate on the Cooperating
Agency team.

Participate in the NEPA process at the earliest possible time; and

Participate in the scoping process; and

Assume on request ofthe Lead Federal Agency responsibility for developing inlormation
and preparing environment analyses including portions olthe sEIS conceming which the
Cooperating Agency has special expertise: and
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l\' Normally use its own funds. The Lead Federal Agency shall, to the extent available funds
permit, fund those major activities or analyses it requests from Cooperating Agencies. The
Lead Federal Agency shall include such funding requirements in their budget requests; and

A Cooperating Agency may, in response to a Lead Federal Agency's request for assistance
in preparing the sEIS, reply that other program commitments preclude the degree ol
involvement requested in the action that is the subject ofthe sEIS; and

Make available staffand/or consultant support, as approved by the individual County, at
the Lead Federal Agency's request to enhance the latter's interdisciplinary capability; and

Designate representative(s) and agree to select individual(s) to represent the County
during Cooperating Agency meetings and communications.

vl.

vu.

C. Formalizes and provides a framework for cooperation and coordination among the Parties
that will ensure completion of the sEIS in a timely, efficient, and thorough mamer; and

E. Ensures the working relationship between the Parties meets the purposes and intent of NEPA.

F. Provides a structural framework for coordination of the NEPA processes.

SECTIONIII. BACKGROUND

A. The Service proposes to revise the 201 5 final rule to the extent necessary to address the
issues on remand from the District Court of Arizona's March 31, 2018 ruling (Center for
Biological Diversity v. Jewell, No. 4:15-cv-00019-JGV (D. Ariz.)). The sEIS will analyze
proposed revisions to some aspects ofcurrently authorized regulations for management ofthe
experimental population of Mexican wolves in Arizona and New Mexico. The Service is
conducting a public scoping period from April I 5 to June 15. 2020 through a Notice of Intent in
the Federal Register. An sEIS will analyze options lbr revising the 2015 Rule and includes
various management scenarios. The proposed l0() rule and draft sEIS will be published for
public comment in or around October 2020. The final sEIS and ROD will be finalized in or
around April 2021 , and the final revised rule will be completed by the court ordered deadline of
May 1,2021.

B. The Parties seek to fully consider the impacts ofproposed actions on the physical, biological,
social and economic aspects ofthe human environment, and;

C. The Parties desire to enter into this MOU and have the authority, through the Regional
Director and the County Supervisors and Commissions, to do so. and;
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D. This MOU shall not be construed to affect the jurisdiction of Federal, State, County or other
local governmental agencies which exists as a matter of law, and:

E. Arizona and New Mexico Counties are legally responsible for the protection of health. safety.
and welfare ofindividuals and communities that mav be affected by reintroduction and recovery
of the Mexican woll

F. Arizona Counties have determined that participation in the revision of the Mexican Wolf
l0O rute sEIS is consistent with the Counties' policies for the protection ofthe health, safety,
and welfare oftheir citizens. and is important to representing the Counties' interest in. and
authority for. management olnatural resources within the boundaries ofthe Counties.

G. New Mexico Counties have determined that participation in the revision olthe Mexican woll
l0() rule sEIS is consistent with the Cournties' policies for the protection ofthe health, safety.
and welfare of their citizens. and is important to representing the Counties' interest in, and
authority for, management of natural resources within the boundaries ofthe Counties.

H. In the interest of enhancing communication, Black's Law Dictionary (7th Edition; ISBN
0314241302) and Meniam-Webster's Collegiate Dictionary (11th Edition; ISBN 0877798095)
shall be the primary references for words used in this MOU;

NOW THEREFORE, the parties hereto agree to cooperatively develop appropriate
documentation in order to satisfy the requirements ofNEPA, and further agree that;

A. The Service will:

i. serve as the Lead Federal Agency in coordinating the development of an sEIS analyzing
the environmental impacts ofproposed revisions to the currently authorized regulations for
the MWEPA, and altematives thereto; and

ii. provide guidance as to proper process, document format, and information required to
satisfy NEPA requirements; and

iii. determine the purpose and need ofthe project, the conclusions ofthe environmental
analysis, which altematives are selected for analysis, and make final determinations on
content relative to applicable statutory and regulatory requirements; and

iv. develop the sEIS. consistent with Federal law, regulation and Department and Agency
policy and will incorporate, to the maximum extent possible consistent with its

SECTION IV. RE,CITALS



responsibility as Lead Federal Agency, the comments, recommendations, and/or data
submitted by Parties in the sEIS planning process; and

v. provide available information and resources for development of the SEIS to the Parties
early and throughout the process; and

vi. provide timely review ofthe sEIS in order to ensure compliance with Service guidelines for
NEPA implementation; and

vii. give, to the maximum extent possible, a reasonable time frame for review and retum of
consolidated and comprehensive comments; and

B. The Counties are recognized to have jurisdiction by law and special expertise and will, at

their discretion:

lt.

lll

IV

provide available information, data (and supporting analyses). comments, and resources for
development ofproper NEPA documentation and the sEIS, including all relevant County
land use plans, policies and local lawst and

provide timely review'of the sEIS in order to ensure compliance with Service guidelines lor
NEPA implementation: and

help collect data to the maximum extent possible, participate in discussions about data
assessment and technical repo(s, prepare selected sections, and provide technical expertise
in order lo assist in evaluating the etTectiveness ofall altematives and the EIS; and

receive working drafts of the sEIS and its altematives and analyses tbr review and comment
in relation to areas ofjurisdictional responsibility and/or special expertise, and identify
potential conflicts with the proposed action; and

retum consolidated and comprehensive comments on working drafts to the Service in an
agreed upon time frame consistent with the planning schedule.

may meet with affected stakeholders and provide comments to the Service at any point in
the development of the sEIS, provided that intemal draft documents are not disseminated
(see Document Control section below).

C. Conflict Resolution. Conflicts between or among the Parties conceming this MOU that
cannot be resolved at the lowest possible level shall be referred to the next higher level, et seq.,
as necessary, for resolution with tull recognition ofthe Service's decision making
responsibilities in the sEIS process.

Legal Effect of MOU: The provisions of any statutes and/or regulations cited in this MOU

MOU Between Arizona & New Mexico Counties and the U.S. Fish and Wildlile Service
Re: sEIS development
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contain legally binding requirements. The MOU itselfdoes not alter. expand, or substitute for
those provisions or regulations. nor is it a regulation itself. Thus, it does not impose legally-
binding requirements on the Pa(ies. Furthermore, this MOU does not create a right ofaction
enfbrceable in a court of law for any of the Parties. Rather, this MOU contains procedural
guidance to assist the Parties in carrying out existing legal requirements. No Party shall be liable
in damages to any other Party or other person for any breach of this agreement. any performance
or failure to perform a mandatory or discretionary obligation imposed by lhis agreement or any
other cause of action arising from this agreement.

Document Control: All intemal working draft documents for the development of any NEPA
documents are pre-decisional and the Parties will ensure that these documents will not be
available for review by individuals or entities other than the Parties to this MOU, unless
otherwise required by applicable law. All documents created, collected. or provided by the
Parties in support ofthe development ofNEPA documents are part ofthe official Service
administrative record and may only be released by the Service to the extent allowable by the
Freedom of Information Act and/or Privacy Act. The Counties will identifu to the Service all
personnel and consultants representing the County who will have access to the documents for the
County and provide signed statements with regards to document control.

Enforcement Authority of the United States. Nothing contained in this MOU is intended to
limit the authority of the United States government to seek civil or criminal penalties or
otherwise fultltl its enforcemenl responsibilities under the ESA or other applicable law.

Notices. All notices, demands, or requests from one Party to another may be personally
delivered, sent by facsimile/email, sent by recognized ovemight delivery service, or sent by mail,
certified or registered, postage prepaid, to the persons set forth below and addressed as follows
or at such other address as any Pa(y may lrom time to time specify to the other Parties in writing
and shall be effective at the time of personal delivery, facsimile/email transmission. or mailing
upon notification ofdelivery by a recognized overnight delivery service or the United States
Postal Service.

Elected officials not to benefit. No member of or delegate to Congress or a staff member to a
member or delegate to Congress shall be entitled to any share or part of this MOU, or to any
benefit that may arise from it.

Availability of funds. lmplementation of this MOU by the Service is subject to the
requirements ofthe Anti-Deflciency' Act and the availability ofappropriated iunds. Nothing in

No partnership. This MOU shall not make or be deemed to make any Party to this agreement
the agent fbr or the partner ol any other Party.
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this MOU will be construed by the parties to require the obligation. appropriation. or expenditure
ofany money liom the U.S. Treasury. The parties acknowledge that the Service will not be
required under this agreement to expend any appropriated funds unless and until an authorized
official ofthat agency affirmatively acts to commit to such expenditures as evidenced in writing.

No third-party beneficiaries. Without limiting the applicability of rights granted to the public
pursuant to the ESA or other Federal Iaw, this MOU shall not create any right or interest in the
public, or any member thereof, as a third-party beneticiary hereof, nor shall it authorize anyone
not a pa(y to this MOU maintain a suit lbr personal injuries or damages pursuant to the
provision of this MOU. The duties. obligations, and responsibilities of the Parties to this MOU
with respect to third Parties shall remain as imposed under existing law.

Amendment. This MOU may be amended upon written agreement of all parties. The Party
proposing the amendment shall provide a statement ofthe reasons for the amendment and an
analysis of its environmental effects.

Termination. Any Party may terminate its participation in this MOU at any time. Any
termination shall be made in writing. Ilnot terminated sooner. this MOU will end upon
agreement of all Parties once the sEIS is final and the Service issues the ROD. Agencies may
submit requests to be signatories to the June 24,2019 MOU fbr Mexican Wolf Recovery and
Conservation for full participation and involvement in the Mexican wolf reintroduction project
The current MOU is available upon request to the Service.

Open Meeting Laws. All parties recognize Counties must comply with their respective states'
open meeting laws and that during the process issues raised in the cooperative agency process
may require discussion and possible action by the County's Board of
Commissioners/Supervisors in an open public forum.

Principal Contacts. The principal contacts for this MOU are:

United States Fish and Wildlife Service
Attn: Brady McGee
New Mexico Ecological Services Field Office

Duplicate originals. This MOU may be executed in any number of duplicate originals. A
complete original of this MOU shall be maintained in the official records of each of the Parties
hereto.
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2105 Osuna NE
Albuquerque, New Mexico 871 I 3

Phone: 505-761-4748

Attn:

Iu.
Attn:

lv.
Attn:

Attn:

ll
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Initiation. This MOU becomes effective upon wrilten concurrence by the referenced signatory
Parties below.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF:

The Parties hereto have executed the MOU as of the last written date below.

Bernalillo County- Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date
Cha rrence Letter sent on Insert Date
Cibola County- Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date
Dona Ana- Concurrence [,etter sent on lnsert Date

Grant County- Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date

Hidalgo County- Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date
Lincoln County- Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date
San Miguel- Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date
McKinley County- Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date
Luna County- Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date
Edd - Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date
Torrance County- Coqc@
Otero County- Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date
Sierra County- Concurrer4e lqryg11qnt on Insert Date
Socorro County- Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date

Valencia County- Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date

ADache Countv- Concurrence Letter sent on lnsert Date
Cochise County- Concurrence Lefter sent on Insert Date
Coconino County Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date
Gila Countv- Concurrence Letter sent on lnsert Date
Maricopa County- Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date

Pinal County- Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date
Santa Cruz- Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date
Yavapai County- Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date
Mohave County- Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date
Pima County- Concurrence Letter sent on Insert Date



















































May 2020 P-Card Report 

Account Department Item Total 

401-2-200 Total Benefit Source (Payroll) $7,503.08  

401-6-611 Total Commissioners ($1,117.47) 

401-6-612 Total County Manager $106.44  

401-6-613 Total Human Resources $5,148.85  

401-6-614 Total Safety ($269.09) 

401-6-616 Total Fire & Emergency Services $1,357.86  

401-6-619 Total Working Capital $176.38  

401-6-621 Total Public Works $1,309.89  

401-6-622 Total Information Technology $11,530.46  

401-6-624 Total Planning & Zoning $3,902.24  

401-6-625 Total Purchasing $141.41  

401-6-631 Total Finance Dept $182.18  

401-6-632 Total Community Development $180.71  

401-6-641 Total Detention Administration $47.96  

401-6-642 Total Adult Detention $3,496.97  

401-6-691 Total Facility Maintenance $14,207.36  

401-6-692 Total Courthouse Maintenance $1,186.29  

401-6-693 Total Facility Maintenance. Health Dept. $478.80  

401-6-694 Total Facility Maintenance. CC Road Dept. $1,913.52  

401-6-696 Total Operating Exp - CCDC $2,794.58  

401-6-699 Total St. Mary Complex $894.49  

401-7-721 Total Clerk Admin $927.69  

401-7-731 Total Assessor Admin $587.46  

401-7-732 Total Assessor Appraisal $398.00  

401-7-741 Total Treasurer Dept. $1,672.64  

401-7-751 Total Sheriff Admin $15,202.05  

401-7-752 Total Sheriff Patrol & Investigation $37,143.08  

402-6-651 Total Road Admin $1,440.12  

402-6-652 Total Road Shop $2,748.02  

402-6-653 Total Road Construction & Maintenance $30,801.47  

407-8-811 Total Dunken FD $743.14  

408-8-812 Total East Grand Plains FD $2,424.50  

409-8-813 Total Penasco FD $2,203.70  

410-8-816 Total Midway FD $4,692.06  

411-8-814 Total Berrendo FD $3,079.58  

411-8-828 Total Berrendo FD $2,490.89  

412-8-815 Total Sierra FD $1,831.14  

413-8-818 Total Rio Felix FD $491.82  

414-8-819 Total Fire District #8 $1,219.18  

427-6-638 Total Indigent $172.68  

430-7-753 Total Law Enforcement $8,411.33  



432-7-761 Total DWI  $5,857.23  

432-7-763 Total CDWI $5,249.00  

432-7-766 Total DWI  $987.12  

435-6-643 Total Court Services $32.65  

437-6-659 Total Environmental Tax $595.68  

452-8-832 Total Flood Dept. $6,463.16  

620-7-725 Total Clerk  $123.64  

628-7-733 Total Assessor $199.00  

631-8-872 Total Other Grant's & Contracts $5,158.53  

631-8-883 Total Other Grant's & Contracts $12,061.97  

631-8-884 Total Other Grant's & Contracts $9,714.17  

631-8-886 Total Other Grant's & Contracts $500.00  

635-6-682 Total Emergency & Capital Outlay $41,222.32  

650-6-684 Total CCDC Construction Fund $14,795.86  

670-6-671 Total Internal Services $7,136.38  

Grand Total 
 

$283,950.17  
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